ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

ASA TOOK POSITIONS ON PROPOSALS HIGHLIGHTED THIS COLOR

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
ASA Position:
Oppose: Does not provide enough length to
terminate and add an end cap; ASPE Design
. " PP . . . . Handbook (2 feet ormore with a cap); no
Revised “dead leg” definition to place a min. length of 1.5 times the pipe diameter. N 0 AN )
Definitions . Reject
BRI s UPC Committee Discussion:
Should not have specific requirements in a
definition; also noted the issues raised in the ASA
position.
Diverter Valve, Gray Water DiverterValve. A valve that directs gray water to the ASA Position:
sanitary drainage system or a subsurface irrigation system. Neutral
Diverter Valve, On Site Treated Nonpotable Water. A key component in the collection
Definitions system to control inflow and overflow in collection tanks intended for on-site Accept as UPC Committee Discussion:
treatment and direct beneficial use. Modified Modification suggested to delete “but not
Diverter Valve. Rainwater. A key component in commercial rainwater catchment limited to in definition of gray water. Also
systems to control high inflow and overflow volumes in rainwater storage tanks. modified to remove the work “key” in definition
of Diverter Valve. Rainwater
ASA Position:
Opposed: Not necessary since a “plumbing
fixture” is included in receptor definition and
requirements for “plumbing fixture are clearly
delineated in the code.
Definitions Revise definition of “flood-level rim” to include “... or fixture ... Accept UPC Committee Discussion:
Sone members supported ASA position and also
leads to confusion when plumbing fixture is
added to the definition. Motion to accept passed
16 yes to 8 no

1|Page

Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
ASA Position:
Oppose: Current definition is consistent with
other industry consensus standards.
UPC Committee Discussion:
. . . General agreement with the position of ASA.
Joint, Press-Connect Elastomeric. A permanentmechanical removable or non- .
L. — . T . Also, suggested to proponent they might want to
removable joint incorporating an elastomeric seal or an elastomeric seal and corrosion . L
017 Definitions 7r istant erip rin S . . . . . Reiect submit a definition for the product they would
017 | Fhedeintisade dthapressns e sl anddan s errnsthatesmanlies . . “
e.ss il rlt . L . ! like recognized. It was noted that “press
connect” is actually defined in Section 6. It was
suggested to modify proposal to deleted Press
Connect definition and have a new definition for
Elastomeric Joint and have Press Connect
definition refer to the new Elastomeric Joint
definition. Motion to modify was defeated.
Listed (Third Party Certified). Equipment or materials included in a list published by a ASA Position:
listing agency (accredited conformity assessment body) that maintains periodic Neutral ’
inspection of current production of listed equipment or materials and whose listing
018 Definitions states either that the equi_pment or maFeriaI cor.n.plies with approved standa.rds or.has Reject UPC Committee Discussion:
been tested and found suitable for use in a specified manner. Terms used to identify . . .
i ) T . . Motion to reject based on terms not being
listed equipment products or materials include “listed,” “certified,” or other terms as . e ”
- - — defined by “listing agency” but rather terms
determined appropriate by the listing agency. being defined by the code
ASA Position:
. . - . . ) Neutral
Public Use Occupancy. Commercial buildings that include, but are not limited to office
- buildings, retail stores, restaurants, industrial, multi-family housing, hotels, motel, . . . .
021 Definitions ) - - Reject UPC Committee Discussion:
arenas, stadiums, and other structures not used for one and two family_dwellings. ) . .
Concern that issues are already defined in the
UPC and Private Use already defines what is
Public
Valve, Balancing. A valve that regulates and controls the return of hot water ASA Position:
to the water heater in a recirculating potable or nonpotable hot water piping ) “ .
L s - Accepted as Oppose: No use of the term “thermostatic flow
026 Definitions system to ensure that specified hot water temperatures are delivered to all P SPpose

point-of-use fixtures within specified time frames and volumes. These
include the following:

Modified

regulating valve in the UPC; Appears only use of
the term in is Appendix L so term should be

2|Page

Form Revision

- 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
(1) Flow Balancing Valve with Memory Stop. Includes globe valve, needle valve, or defined in the Appendix to avoid use of the term
venturi valve design with ports for reading temperature and pressure, knob balancing valve used in other sections of the
adjustment with graduated set-point markings, and lockable memory setting. code. The terms “Pressure-Balancing Valve” and
(2). Preset Automatic F!ow Contrgl Vglve. A f!x_ed orifice valve regulates flow by “Combination Thermoplastic/Pressure Balancing
using a spring me.chamsm to maintain a spgaﬂed flow over a var.lety of pressures. Valve” are currently defined in the UPC.
These function with replaceable flow cartridges, each having a different flow rate
orifice assembly and with different pressure differentials. . ) .
(3) Thermostatic Flow Regulating Valve. Mechanical thermostatically controlled UPC Committee Discussion
valves that automatically self-adjust return water flow to maintain specified Motion to amend, strike hot and potable and
temperatures in the hot water circuits. non-potable in first sentence. And Deleted
everything from “These include the following:
... Motion to modify was accepted.
Modifications address ASA Position.
ASA Position:
Modify proposal to add “... where food is
consumed indoors...”.
L . “ . UPC Committee Discussion
Definitions Adds a definition for “water station Approve A rerseeel e 0 e el ek GBS whiare
food is consumed indoors” Trying to differentiate
between water bottle fillers and drinking
fountains which are already defined. This
modification was not accepted. Motion to
approve passed with 12 yes and 10 no
301.3 Alternate Materials and Methods of Construction Equivalency. Unless ASA Position:
Section 3. specifically prohibited, Nnothing in this code is intended to prevent the use of systems, Neutral
General methods, or devices of equivalent or superior quality, strength, fire resistance, Approved
Regulations effectiveness, durability, and safety over those prescribed by this code. ...... UPC Committee Discussion
No notes taken.
ASA Position:
Adds the revised definition of “dead leg” with the min. length of 1.5 times the tgeE‘)_rm()i;z;ceD:EZ r;?jtdpar:\ggj ce::'uAg:PIEerl;g:;gtg
Section 309.6 | diameter into 309.6. Dead Legs. Rejected !

Handbook (2 feet ormore with a cap); no
technical substantiation provided

3|Page

Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
UPC Committee Discussion:
Supported ASA positions
310.0 Prohibited Fittings and Practices. .
ASA Position:
310.1 Fittings. No double hub fitting, single or double tee branch, single or double Neutral
Section 310. tapped tee branch, .5|d.e inlet quarter bend,.runnlng thread, band, or saddI.e shall be Approve
used as a drainage fitting except-thatb-sanitary-tapped-tee-shall-be-permitted to-be UPC Committee Discussion:
No discussion, vote was unanimous by consent
ASA Position:
Oppose: the carrier fitting is what is attached to
Revises second paragraph of 402.6 Flanged Fixture Connections to read, “Wall- ;c:jus:trruc:;rs;;f;zSs]?()c:l:anr:iifr'esrences appropriate
Section 402.6 | mounted water closet fixtures shall be securely bolted to the structure with an Reject ¥ '
LR G AT S UPC Committee Discussion:
See item 048
. Add ASME A112.4.3 as a requirement for elastomeric gasket flange to the fixture . UPC Committee Discussion:
Section 402.6 | connector. Reject . .
Over restrictive and appears to be proprietary.
ASA Position:
Neutral
Revi the last ¢ ¢ Section 402.6 FI d Eixture © i ¢ J UPC Committee Discussion:
evises the last sentence of Section .6 Flanged Fixture Connections to read, Committee members noted that the flange
. “The bottom of the flange shall be set on an-approvedfirm-base the top of the Approve as . . &
Section 402.6 . 8 e should be installed at the top of the finished
finished floor. Modified

floor. Motion to accept as modified by adding to
the second paragraph, “Wall-mounted water
closet fixtures shall be securely bolted to an
approved carrier fitting. The approved carrier
fitting shall be securely bolted to the structure.

Motion to accept as modified accepted by
consent.

4|Page

Form Revision

- 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
Revises 402.6.1 Closet Rings (Closet Flanges) fourth, fifth and sixth paragraphs as
follows:
the-clesetringbefore-the reugh-inspectioniscalled: Where the closet ring is installed
on the closet bend or riser, the finished joint shall be present a smooth surface flush
with the top of the closet ring.
ASA Position:
Closet rings (closet flanges) shall be adequately designed with the bottom of the Oppose. No value being added.
ring or flange positioned on the finished floor and secured to support fixtures
Section connected thereto. UPC Committee Discussion:
402.6.1 and Offset closet rings (closet flanges) shall be free of ledges and corners that would Reject Move to reject 49, 50 and 51 and accept 52.
402.6.3 obstruct flow shall be permitted for floor discharge water closets. Item 49 does not add additional value. Also, not
sure what the phrase, “floor discharge water
Revise 402..3 Securing Floor-Mounted, Back-Outlet Water Closet Bowls, last two closet” means. Motion to reject passed based on
sentence to read: consent approval.
The closet flange shall be firmly secured tea-firm-base. Wherefloermounted back-
outlet wate sseisreses—theseilsiserchall berside 3 -
diameter: Offset, eccentric reducing closet flanges shall not be used permitted with
these fixtures.
ASA Position:
Section 402.6.1 Closet Rings (Closet Flanges), third paragraph is being revised: lpfpiosies St it Al weiiien el
water temperatures to be 120 deg max for
. Closet rings (closet flanges) shall be joined as approved for the specific material in bathtubs ar!d showers; would limit temperature
Section . . . at kitchen sink.
accordance with Section 705.0 burned-ersoldered-tolead-bendsorstubs,shall-be Reject
402.6.1 s T
T e Ry e e T ’ UPC Committee Discussion:
Move to reject 49, 50 and 51 while accepting 52.
Motion to reject by unanimous consent.
Section The following is being added to the end of Section 402.6.1 Closet Rings (Closet Flanges) . ASA Position:
Reject
402.6.1 Neutral

5|Page

Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
Offset, eccentric, or reducing floor mounted closet flanges that create a ledge or
otherwise constrict the full opening g of the water closet shall not be used. UPC Committee Discussion:
Move to reject 49, 50 and 51 while accepting 52.
The following changes are being proposed for the end of Section 402.6.3 Securing
Floor-Mounted, Back-Outlet Water Closet Bowls: ASA Position:
Section Neutral
052 Offset, eccentric, or reducing closet flanges shall not be permitted with these fixtures. Accept
402.6.3 - . . .
Vitere-lesrmsuniedbaccauidoinniordasaisarawsad hasail UPC Committee Discussion:
j g -l -0 i ng Move to reject 49, 50 and 51 while accepting 52.
ASA Position:
Oppose. Conflicts with A117.1; 403.3 already
requires pipes to be insulated; proposal would
Proposal adds the following new item to section 403.0 Accessible Plumbing Facilities limit in certain applications kitchen sink faucet
temp to 110 F.
. 403.4 Temperature Limits at Accessible Plumbing Fixtures. The maximum water .
053 S A R temperature discharging from any accessible plumbing fixture shall be limited to a Reject UPC Committee Discussion:
maximum of 110 F (43 C) by one of the methods prescribed in Section 408.3.2 Move to reject item 53 since it is an ADA issue,
reject 60 due to requirement is based on
temperature limiting not monitoring. Accept
item 59
Item 404.2 Overflows is being revised as follows:
Where a fixture is provided with an overflow, the overflow shall comply with Section gSA Posglont: S, ith “It shall
404.2.1 and Section 404.2.2. ppose due to existing text starting with it sha
be unlawful to connect ....
. . . . Approved as
054 Section 404.0 | 404.2.1 Sinks and Bathtubs. tThe waste shall be so arranged that the standing water in o . X )
- . : L Modified UPC Committee Discussion:
the fixture shall not rise in the overflow where the stopper is closed or remain in the .
. . . . Proposed modification to delete last sentence of
overflow where the fixture is empty. The overflow pipe from a fixture shall be connected . " .
existing text and the addition of lavatory in the
to the house or |n|et S|de of the fixture trap —exeept—that—everﬂew—ea—ﬂush—tanks—sha“—be . e s e
title. Modification addresses ASAs position.
2 e A-but it shall be
unlawful to connect such overflows W|th any other part of the dramage system.

6|Page

Form Revision

- 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

shower enclosure of not more than 2.5 gpm at 80 psi (9.5 L/m at 552 kPa).

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
402.2.2 Closets and Urinals. Overflows on flush tanks shall be permitted to discharge
into the water closets or urinals served by them.
ASA Position:
Oppose. As written would require all group
wash fixtures to comply with IGC 156.
UPC Committee Discussion:
Motion to reject since it would require every
Section 407.0 IAPMO IGC 156, Wash Fountains and Lavatory Systems with or without Water Closets is Reiect product to comply when there are other
’ being added to Section 407.0 Lavatories, item 407.1 Application. ) standards already addressed. In addition, 401.2
is a general section and is over restrictive to put
a standard in that section.
ASA Position:
Modify to: A public lavatory shall have access to
a soap dispenser.
UPC Committee Discussion:
Add the followi tion:
g € foflowing new section Concern that it is too restrictive and belongs in
Section 407.0 407.7 Soap Dispenser. Each public lavatory shall have an accompanying soap Reject the Building Code. A modlflcal:clon wa:s
7d' recommended to change to: “Soap Dispenser:
Ispenser. soap dispensers shall be provided for public
lavatories.”
Motion to reject passed with a vote of 17 yes to
6 no
408.0 Showers. ASA Position:
Section 408.0 | 408.2 Water Consumption. Showerheads shall have a maximum flow rate of not more Approve as Oppose. Applying the 2.5 gpm to “total per
than 2.5 gpm at 80 psi (9.5 L/m at 552 kPa). Body_sprays shall have a flow rate for the Modified shower enclosure”, instead of individual body

sprays, is not consistent with industry standards.

7|Page

Form Revision

- 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

alert if mixed water exceeds 120°F (49°C) at the outlet. Temperature can also be

adjusted via remote means.

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
2040 -B- In additi_on, a!though the term “body sp_ra_w_” is_
Body Spray. A shower device for spraying water onto a bather from other than the now defined in DOE regulation, the definition is
overhead position. provided to clarify that “body sprays” are not
covered in DOE energy and water efficiency
requirements.
UPC Committee Discussion:
Motion to modify is to delete “for the shower
enclosure” to show the 2.5 gpm is related to
each body spray.
. Add IAPMO PS 106, Tileable Shower Receptors and Shower Kits to 408.0 Showers . .
Section 408.0 Did not get results on this proposal.
Delete following from item 408.3.2 Temperature Limiting, for individual shower and G L
. Support proposal
tub-shower combination control valves:
Section L UPC Committee Discussion:
' Approve Move to reject item 53 since it is an ADA issue,
408.3.2 oA BADE 2 . . .
reject 60 due to requirement is based on
temperature limiting not monitoring. Accept
item 59 approved based on consent approval.
ASA Position:
Neutral
Add following to the end of 408.3.2 Temperature Limiting: UPC Committee Discussion:
Move to reject item 53 since it is an ADA issue,
. (6) Remote temperature monitoring, control and alert when lack line of sight. reject 60 due to requirement is based on
Section - - - . N S
408.3.2 Temperature shall be permitted to be monitored remotely_via a sensor and App to Reject temperature limiting not monitoring. Accept

item 59. Motion to reject approved by consent.

Public comment from Watts indicated a
modification to delete monitoring might be
acceptable to the Committee.

8|Page

Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

e

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
ASA Position:
Support proposal
Add new item referencing ASSE 1066-1997 Individual Pressure Balancing In-Line Valves . . .
061 Section 408.3 | for Individual Fixture Fittings. Reject UPC Committee Discussion:
- : gs. ) Motion to reject because code already addresses
in another section of the code.
ASA Position:
Neutral
Add item 408.3.4
newitem UPC Committee Discussion:
408.3.4 Temperature-Actuated, Flow-Reduction Devices for Individual Fixture MOtl,o,n to. modify by deleting se.cond sentence.
s B - - . Modification based on the requirement already
Fittings. Temperature-actuated, flow-reduction devices, where installed for individual beine addressed in other part of the standard
fixture fittings, shall comply with ASSE 1062. A temperature- actuated, flow-reduction Motﬁ)n failed P ’
. device shall be an approved method for limiting the water temperature to not more Approve as
062 Section 408 S o N . K .
than 120°F (49°C) at the outlet of a faucet or fixture fitting. Such devices shall not be Modified . . .
B - .. Motion to accept as submitted did not pass.
used alone as a substitute for the balanced- pressure, thermostatic or combination
shower valves.re.q.uwements or a§ a substitute for bathtub or whirlpool tub water- Motion to reject did not pass with a vote of 2 yes
temperature-limiting valves requirements.
to 22 no
Motion to accepts as modified (delete second
sentence) was made again and passed by
consent.
Item 408.4 Waste Outlet is revised as follows: ASA Position:
Neutral
408.4 Waste Outlet. Showers shall have a waste outlet and fixture tailpiece not less
063 Section 408.4 than 2 inches (50 mm) in diameter. Fixture tailpieces shall be constructed from the Reject UPC Committee Discussion:
inage piping. Strainrers serving-shewer Motion to reject based on installers belief it is
ent-to-the-area-of the tailpiece important to have the requirements in the code
and not have to go to a reference standard.
9|Page Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

S

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
Motion to reject passed with a vote of 19 yes to
5no
Revise third sentence of 408.5 Finished Curb or Threshold: ASA Position:
Neutral
... Each such receptor shall be provided with an integral nailing flange either integral or Apbrove as
064 Section 408.5 field installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions. te-be I\F;IK;dified UPC Committee Discussion:
ocated-were the receptormeetsthevert s se-aihe-nisheddntariaraihe Motion to modify by deleting “”an integral”
chevrereamearbnent before “nailing flange”
Revise 408.6 Shower Compartments as follows: ASA Position:
Neutral
408.6 Shower Compartments. Shower compartments+regareless-of shape; shall have
a minium finished interior of in accordance with the following: Approve as UPC Committee Discussion:

065 Section 408.6 2 . . . .
(1)_Not less than 1024 square inches (0.6606 m<). and-shat-alse-be-capableof Modified Motion to approve as modify by striking new text
encompassing in (2) and put back the deleted text, “and shall
(2) Be of sufficient dimension to accommodate a 30 inch (762 mm) circle. also be capable of encompassing”

Passed based on consent approval.
. . - ASA Position:
Add following to the end of section 408.7 Lining for Showers and Receptors: Neutr:ISI fon

066 i . i j

066 Section 408.7 | Unless the shower recept(?r is poured on the gr(?und as pa rt. of aslab, an a.pprov.ed Reject UPC Committee Discussion:
shower liner shall be provided in accordance with the requirements of this section. . . .

Motion to reject. Motion passed by consent
approval.
Revised 408.7.5 Tests for Shower Receptors revised:
408.7.5 Tests for Shower Receptors. Shower receptors shall be tested for ASA P°|5iti°":
- watertightness by filling with water to the leveleftherough-threshold a depth of Neutra

067 ection not less than 2 inches (51 mm) for not less than 15 minutes. Where no threshold Accepted . . .

- 408.7.5 : - - - . UPC Committee Discussion:
is present, a 2 inch (51 mm) barrier shall be temporarily constructed for testing. . vt

- Motion to accept (note the word “the” was
The test plug shall be so placed that both upper and under sides of the subpan o ”
¢ ] o ; editorially removed”. Approved by consent.
shall be subjected to the test at the point where it is clamped to the drain.
10| Page Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

e

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
Revise 408.9 Location of Valves and Heads:
408.9 Location of Valves and Heads. Control valves and showerheads shall be ASA Position:
located on the a sidewall of the shower compartments-eretherwise and arranged Neutral
. so that the showerhead does not discharge directly at the entrance te into the .
068 section 408.9 shower compartment se-that and the bather can adjust the valve(s) before stepping Reject UPC Committee Discussion:
into the shower spray. Motion to reject passed with a vote of 15 yes to
8 no
Exception: Shower valve(s) or shower head(s) can be placed in an alternate location
when approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction.
Add following to section 409.4 Limitation of Hot Water Temperature in Bathtubs and
Whirlpool Bathtubs: ASA Position:
Neutral
069 Section 409.4 (3) Remote temperature monitoring, control and alert when lack line of sight. Reiect
— ’ Temperature shall be permitted to be monitored remotely via a sensor and App to alert ) UPC Committee Discussion:
if mixed water exceeds 120F (49°C) at the outlet. Temperature can also be adjusted via Motion to reject due to not being enforceable.
remote means. Motion approved based on consent.
409.6.1 Suction Fittings. Suction fittings on whirlpool bathtubs shall comply with ﬁseﬁ\tFr’;smon:
070 Section 409 ASME A;.12.19.7./C.SA B45..10. Approve
(renumber remaining sections) UPC Committee Discussion:
Motion to accept.
ASA Position:
Oppose. Hydraulic performance already covered
. Add item 411.2 under 411.0 Water Closets requiring water closet hydraulic . I T SERESE AN e e APYIE SEmERIEs:
071 section 411.0 erformance comply with ASME A112.19.2/CSA B45/1 Reject
P Pl T UPC Committee Discussion:
Move to reject due to existing standards already
addresses the issues.
Revise sections of 411.0 Water Closets: ASA Position:
072 Section Reiect Oppose. ASME and IAPMO standards do not
- 411.2.1 411.2.1 Dual Flush Water Closets. Dual flush water closets shall comply with ) appear to be equivalent. ASME A112.19.10 has
ASME A112.19.14 or IAPMO PS 50. The effective flush volume for dual flush never been accepted by the industry.
11| Page Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

performance for urinals using water for flushing shall be in accordance with ASME
A112.19.2/CSA B45.1 or CSA B45.5/IAPMO 7124.

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
water closets shall be defined as the composite, average flush volume of two
reduced flushes and one full flush. UPC Committee Discussion:
Motion to reject approved by consent.
411.2.2 Dual Flush Valves. Dual flush water closet valves shall comply with
IAPMO PS 50 or ASME A112.19.10.
ASA Position:
Oppose. Proposal would prohibit plastic toilet
Revise 411.3 Water Closets: seats and no technical data provided to support
proposed change.
411.3 Water Closet Seats. Water closet seats shall be properly sized for the water
closet bowl type, and shall be of smooth, non-absorbent material. Seats, for public UPC Committee Discussion:
Section 411.3 | or employee use, shall be of the elongated type and either of the open front type Reject Motion to reject due to not enforceable and you
or have an automatic seat cover dispenser. Plastic seats shall comply with IAPMO do not need a permit to change a water closet
Z2124.5.Seats that are integral to the water closet shall be of the same material as seat. Would prohibit a plastic seat from being
the fixture. installed on a ceramic toilet. Motion to reject
was by consent.
411.3 Water Closet Seats. Water closet seats shall be properly sized for the water ASA Position:
. . ition:
closet bowl type, and shall be of smooth, non-absorbent material. Seats, for public Neutral
use, shall be of the elongated type and either of the open front type or have an
Section 411.3 x:sr&a;'l\;éeat cover dispenser. Plastic seats with or without covers shall comply Reject UPC.Commit.tee Piscussion:
7124.5. Motion to reject since standards already address
covers. Motion to reject by consent.
ASA Position:
412.1 Application. Urinals shall comply with ASME A112.19.2/CSA B45.1, ASME Opgreone. [ el el [peralrin e e ) eovemed
A112.19.19, or CSA B45.5/IAPMO Z124. Urinals shall have an average water in standards currently referenced.
Section 412.1 consumption not to exceed 1 gallon (3.8 Lpf) of water per flush. The hydraulic Reject UPC Committee Discussion:

Move to reject due to existing standards already
addresses the issues.

12| Page

Form Revision

- 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

e

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
Delete second sentence of 412.1.1 ASA Position:
Neutral
412.1.1 Nonwater Urinals. Nonwater urinals shall have a liquid barrier sealant to
. maintain atrap seal. Flo e vna s b e sl b B e e e s . UPC Committee Discussion:
076 . . . . .
B section 412.1 through-the-urinalto-the sanitary-drainage-system- Nonwater urinals shall be Reject Motion to reject due to the flow is needed in
cleaned and maintained in accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions after case of a backup. Motion passed by consent.
installation.
Revise first sentence of 412.1.1 and definition: ASA Position:
. . N . Neutral
412.1.1 Nonwater Urinals. Nonwater urinals shall have a liquid barrier sealant or a
membrane valve to maintain a trap seal. Nonwater urinals shall permit the uninhibited . . .
flow of waste through the urinal to the sanitary drainage system UPC Committee Discussion:
077 Section 412.1 € ¥ e sy ’ Reject No standard for a membrane valve and a valve
d t id ivalent of a liquid seal.
Trap. A fitting or device so designed and constructed as to provide, where properly oes_ not provige equivalent ot a fiquid sea
L . ) Motion passed by consent.
vented, a liquid seal or a membrane valve that will prevent the back passage of air
without materially affecting the flow of sewage or wastewater through it.
415.0 Drinking Fountains.
415.1  Application. Drinking fountains shall be self-closing and comply with
ASME A112.19.1/CSA B45.2, ASME A112.19.2/CSA B45.1, or ASME A112.19.3/CSA .
B45.4. Drinking fountains and bottle filling stations shall also comply with NSF 61. Aeslcaion:
Permanently installed electric water coolers and bottle filling stations shall also SUp[pe
comply with UL 399.
083 Section 415.0 Pl L. . 5 . . Reject UPC Committee Discussion:
415.2  Drinking Fountain Alternatives. Where food is consumed indoors, water . . .
: . . . . - Motion to modify be putting deleted text back
stations shall be permitted to be substituted for drinking fountains. Bottle filling .
hall " Kine f in. Concern that not everyone has a bottle
stations shall be permitted to be substituted for drinking fountains up te-58 available. Motion passed with 23 yes to 1 no
percentoftherequirementsfor-drinkingfountains. Drinking fountains shall not
be required for an occupant load of 30 or less.
. . ASA Position:
Add following under 416.0 Emergency Eyewash and Shower Equipment Neutr:ISI fon
084 i j
- Section 416 416.3 Remote Temperature Monitoring. Control and alert when lack line of sight. Reject . . .
- - I UPC Committee Discussion:
Temperature may be monitored remotely via a sensor and App to alert if mixed water . . .
Motion to reject. Motion passed by consent.

13| Page

Form Revision

- 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
exceeds 85F (29.4 C) at the outlet. Temperature can also be adjusted via remote
means.
ASA Position:
Proposal moves the following items in Section 417 to Section 603.0 Cross-Connection SA Position . .
Control: Oppose. Not all requirements being moved
. ’ rtain t kfl tection; ti
Section 417 417.2 Deck Mounted Bath/Shower Valves . S A7 I s |9n
and 603 417.3 Handheld Showers Reject 603.5.19 already covers backflow protection.
417.4 F t Fixt Fitti ith H C t tlet
aucets and Fixture Fittings wi ose Connected Outlets UPC Committee Discussion:
Motion to reject approved by consent.
Revise first sentence of 417.5 Separate Controls for Hot and Cold Water .
ASA Position:
417.5 Separate Controls for Hot and Cold Water. Where two separate handles Oppose
Section 417 control the hot and cold water, the handles shall be marked in such a manner to Reject UPC Committee Discussion:
indicate to the user that the left-hand control of the faucet where facing the Motion to reiect. Motion ;ssed based on
fixture fitting outlet shall control the hot water. ot B
consent.
417.0 Faucets and Fixture Fittings.
Bendkede ke have s resereaieventac e the ntrresehera shall comanb ool AECE ASA Position:
Lo Elesiedovicosthaihenivmiorshalleamp o 4000 Request the deletion of “one of the following”.
_ 417.6 Water Dispensers. All potable water dispensers directly_connected to the ) UPC_Commit_tee Discussion: )
Section 417 plumbing system shall comply with one of the following: Reject Motion to”reject. The propo.saI"shouId be: revised
a. Beverage faucets shall comply with ASME A112.18.1/CSA B125.1. to delete “one of the following™ and clarify that
b. Dispensers that supply electrically heated or wa;ehr dlzpenszr_s from carbonat;ed beve:jasesth
cooled water shall comply with ASSE 1023. (3) Electric i:w raenuif:r:\e:t’;enl\jli)rtsic?r:e ZZseiio‘éer:onsZnt €
devices that heat water shall comply with UL 499. 9 ’ P v ’
(4) Dispensers that include water treatment shall comply with ASSE 1023 and
Section 611.0 based on the type of water treatment technology.
Section 417 417.7 Head Shampoo Sink Faucets. Head shampoo sink faucets shall be supplied Reiect ASA Position:
ection with hot water that is limited to not more than 120°F (49°C). Each faucet shall elec Neutral
14| Page Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

S

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
have integral check valves to prevent crossover flow between the hot and cold
water supply connections. The means for regulating the maximum temperature UPC Committee Discussion:
shall be in accordance with one of the following: Motion to reject. It would require the sourcing
(1) A limiting device conforming to ASSE 1070/ASME A112.1070/CSA B125.70. (2) A of hot water. Note sure why a 1082 compliance
water heater conforming to ASSE 1084. would not be acceptable. Motion rejected by
(3) A temperature-actuated, flow-reduction device conforming to ASSE 1062. consent.
417.0 Faucets and Fixture Fittings.
ASA Position:
417.8 Footbaths and Pedicure Baths. The water supplied to specialty plumbing Neutral
fixtures, such as pedicure chairs having an integral foot bathtub and footbaths,
089 Section 417 shaI.I be limited to not more than 1202F (492C) by a water- temperature-limiting Reject. UPC Committee Discussion:
device that corllform.s to ASSE 1070/ASME A112.1070/CSA B125.70 or by a water Motion to reject based on implied requirement
heater complying with ASSE 1084. for hot water. Motion accepted by consent.
ASA Position:
Support
. Revises 420.3 Pre-Rinse Spray Valve to incorporate maximum flow rates as required in
091 Section 420.3 . A . . .
o ection DOE regulations. pprove UPC Committee Discussion:
Motion to accept approved based on consent.
Add following footnotes to Table 422.1 Minimum Plumbing Facilities under the “Other”
category
6  Service sinks shall not be required for non-residential occupancies with an
1 . . ..
092 Table 422.1 occupaht load of 15 or Ies.s . . Did not document decision
7  For business and mercantile occupancies, one common service sink shall be
permitted when accessible to all businesses and mercantile within 300 feet and
within the same story.
Add following exception to 422.2 Separate Facilities:
ASA Position:
(4) Separate facilities shall not be required where rooms have fixtures designed for use Neutral
093 Section 422.2 by both sexes and the water closets are installed in privacy compartments. Urinals shall Reject

be located in an area that is visually separated from the remainder of the room or each
urinal shall be installed in a privacy compartment.

UPC Committee Discussion:
Motion to reject passed based on 12 yes to 9 no

15| Page

Form Revision

- 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

S

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
Add new item under Section 422.0 Minimum Number of Required Fixtures
Multiple Occupancy Buildings. Buildings having multiple types of occupancies,
shall have separate toilet facilities for each occupancy with the minimum
number of fixtures prescribed in Table 422.1. A common set of restrooms shall
be permitted to be used to accommodate all of the building occupants when the .
following requirements are met: ASA Position:
Neutral
. (1) Restrooms shall be accessible to the occupants at all times. . . . )
094 Section 422.2 . B Reject UPC Committee Discussion:
(2) The maximum travel distance from the restrooms to any occupancy . : P
Motion to reject. No technical justification for
shall not exceed 300 feet (91 440 mm). . . .
— . . 300 ft. and a bit confusing. Motion passed by
(3) The total occupant load for the building shall be determined by adding consent
the individual occupant loads together. The minimum number of '
fixtures for the common restrooms shall be calculated at 50 percent
female and 50 percent male based on the total occupant load and by
using the occupancy requiring the greatest number of fixtures per
occupant load in accordance with Table 422.1.
Add new item under Section 422.4 Toilet Facilities Serving Employees and Customers .
ASA Position:
422.4.2 Factory, Industrial and Storage. The location and maximum distances of Neutral
095 Section 422.4 travel to required public and employee facilities in factory, industrial and storage Reject . . A
- - ; - - UPC Committee Discussion:
occupancies shall be permitted to exceed that required by Section 422.4, . . .
N - - - Motion to reject and not enforceable with no
provided that the location and maximum distance of travel are approved. . .
clear requirements. Motion passed by consent.
603.5.17 Potable Water Outlets and Valves. Potable water outlets, freeze-proof ASA Position:
yard hydrants, combination stop-and- waste valves, freeze resistant drinking Oppose. Term sanitary is not defined and
fountains or other fixtures that incorporate a stop and waste feature that drains proposal may be proprietary.
into the ground shall not be installed underground.
130 Exception: Drinking fountain freeze resistant sanitary shall be permitted to be installed Reiect UPC Committee Discussion:
- underground. ) Motion to reject. The term sanitary may conflict
with the way it is used in the code. There should
206.0 -D- be a separation between the potable and
Drinking Fountain Freeze Resistant. An outdoor point of use valve used for potable nonpotable requirements. Motion passed by
water systems that uses a stop and waste below the frost line to protect against consent.
16 |Page Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

e

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
freezing. The device is normally installed in a vertical position extending from below
the frost line to above grade.
Drinking Fountain Freeze Resistant Sanitary. An outdoor point of use valve used for
potable water systems that drains back into an internal reservoir below the frost line
to protect against freezing The device is normally installed in a vertical position
extending from below the frost line to above grade.
603.5.17 Potable Water Outlets and Valves. Potable water outlets, freeze-proof non-
sanitary_yard hydrants, combination stop-and-waste valves, or other fixtures that
incorporate a stop and waste feature that drains into the ground shall not be installed
underground. ASA Position:
Exception: Freeze-resistant sanitary yard hydrants that meet the requirements of ASSE Oppose. A “sanitary hydrant” does not require
1057 shall be permitted to be installed underground. components that would lend it to being sanitary.
227.0 -Y- May be proprietary.
Yard Hydrant. A point-of-use valve used for nonpotable water systems that is
131 protected against freezing by draining residual water onto the soil (which can be a Reject UPC Committee Discussion:
source of cross-contamination). The device is normally installed in a vertical position Motion to reject. The term sanitary may conflict
extending from below the frost line to above grade. with the way it is used in the code. There should
Yard Hydrant, Sanitary. A point-of-use valve used for potable water systems that be a separation between the potable and
drains back into an internal reservoir below the frost line to protect against freezing. nonpotable requirements. Moition passed by
The device incorporates a backflow prevention device with hose connection outlet for consent.
potable water application. The device is normally installed in a vertical position
extending from below the frost line to above grade.
ASA Position:
Neutral
Add IAPMO IGC 353 - Branch Connectors to Table 604.1 — Materials for Building Supply
137 Table 604.1 and Water Distribution Piping and Fittings in the material row for stainless steel. Also Reject UPC Committee Discussion:
add IAPMO document to Table 1701.1 — Referenced Standards Motion to reject based on it not being applicable
building water supply.
Add ASTM F3347 — Metal Press Insert Fittings with Factory Assembled Stainless Steel ASA Position:
138 Table 604.1 Press Sleeve for SDR9 Cross-Linked PEX Tubing and SDR9 P-RT Tubing and ASTM F3348 Reject Neutral

— Standard Specification for Plastic Press Insert Fittings with Factory Assembled
Stainless Steel Press Sleeve for SDR9 PEX Tubing and SDR9 PE_RT Tubing to Table 604.1

UPC Committee Discussion:

17 |Page

Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
— Materials for Building Supply and Water Distribution Piping and Fittings and to Table Concern raised about the table showing both
1701.1 — Referenced Standards. Building Supply and Water Distribution is
checked and ASTM F3347 is not scoped for both.
It was noted that there are other standards
already in the table just for Water Distribution.
Motion to reject passed with a vote of 13 yes, 6
no and 3 abstentions.
Revise Exception section of 604.2 Lead Content: ASA Position:
Oppose.
Exceptions:
Section 604.2 (1) Pipes, pipe fittings, plumbing fittings, or fixtures er-backflow-preventers-used for Reject UPC Committee Discussion:
nonpotable services such as manufacturing, industrial processing, irrigation, outdoor Motion to reject based on it not being consistent
watering, or any other uses where the water is not used for human consumption. with Federal Regulations. Motion passed with a
vote of 21 yes to 2 no
604.0 Materials.
ASA Position:
Oppose
604.12 Flexible Cerrugated Connectors. Flexible eerrugated-connectorsof
Section 604.5 | copperrcopperalloy orstainlesssteel water connectors shall be installed in UPC Committee Discussion:
and 12 readily_accessible locations and shall comply with ASME A112.18.6/CSA B125.6. Reject Motion to reject based on attempting to take
Flexible water connectors with an excess flow shutoff device shall comply with requirements for corrugated connectors and
CSA B125.5/IAPMO Z600. Such connectors shall be limited to the following apply to all connectors with a lack of technical
connector lengths: justification and no background to support 48 in.
c. Fixture Connectors — 30 inches (762 mm) Motion accepted based on consent approval.
d. Washing Machine Connectors — 72 inches (1829 mm)
e. Dishwasher and Icemaker Connectors — 120 inches (3048 mm)
(4) Other Connections — 48 inches (1220 mm)
Section 605 Place the following new sentence at the end of Section 605.1.3.3 Push Fittings: Reject gi];:;snlon:

18| Page

Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -

I UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings
UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position

Fittings used in potable water systems intended to supply drinking water shall comply UPC Committee Discussion:

with NSF 61. Motion to reject based on the requirement
already covered under 604.1 and is already
covered in the product standard. Motion passed
by consent.

606.1 General. Valves up to and including 2 inches (50 mm) in size shall be copper

alloy or other approved material. Sizes exceeding 2 inches (50 mm) shall be

permitted to have cast iron or copper alloy bodies or other approved materials. Each

gate or ball valve shall be a fullway or full-port type with working parts of the

noncorrosive material. Valves carrying water used in potable water systems ASA Position:

intended-to-supply-drinkingwater shall comply with theregquirements of NSF 61 Neutral

152 Section 606 and ASME A112.4.14, ASME B16.34, ASTM F1970, ASTM F2389, AWWA C500, Reject

AWWA C504, AWWA C507, IAPMO IGC 312, IAPMO Z1157, MSS SP-67, MSS SP-70, UPC Committee Discussion:

MSS SP-71, MSS SP-72, MSS SP-78, MSS SP-80, MSS SP-110, MSS SP-122, or NSF Move to reject based on consent.

359. Valves carrying water intended to supply drinking water shall also comply

with NSF 61.

606.1 General. Valves up to and including 2 inches (50 mm) in size shall be copper

alloy or other approved material. Sizes exceeding 2 inches (50 mm) shall be

permitted to have cast iron or copper alloy bodies. Each gate or ball valve shall be a

fullway or full-port type with working parts of the noncorrosive material. Valves ASA Position:

carrying water used in potable water systems intended-to-supply-drinking-water Neutral

153 Section 606 shall comply with the requirements of NSF-61 and ASME A112.4.14, ASME B16.34, Accept

ASTM F1970, ASTM F2389, AWWA C500, AWWA C504, AWWA C507, IAPMO UPC Committee Discussion:

721157, MSS SP-67, MSS SP-70, MSS SP-71, MSS SP-72, MSS SP-78, MSS SP-80, MSS Move to accept based on consent.

SP-110, MSS SP-122, or NSF 359. Valves intended to supply drinking water shall

also comply with the requirements of NSF 61.

ASA Position:
B . . Neutral
606.9 Leak Detection Devices. Where digital leak detection devices for water supply
155 Section 606 Ia:Fc’jl\;Ijlostzrlltgliltéon are installed, they shall comply with IAPMO {G€-115-e+ARPMOGE 349 Reject UPC Committee Discussion:

- Motion to reject based on the IAPMO standard is
not limited to digital devices. Motion passed
based on consent.

19| Page Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
606.9 Leak Detection Devices. Where leak detection devices for water supply and
distribution are shall comply with IARMOIGE115-6+APMOIGE349 IAPMO Z1349.
ASA Position:
Section 606 L 405.0 Leak Detection and Control. Neutral
and 405 L 405.1 General. Where installed, leak detection and control devices shall Accept
comply with tARPMOGC 115 o+ HARPMO1GE 349 IAPMO Z1349. Leak UPC Committee Discussion:
detection and control devices help protect property from water damage and Motion to accept passed based on consent.
also conserve water by shutting off the flow when leaks are detected.
Add following footnote to Table 603.3 — Water Supply Fixture Units and Minimum
Fixture Branch Pipe Sized. Footnote would apply to following:
e  Bathtub or Combination Bath Shower
e Bidet ASA Position:
e  Dishwasher (domestic) Support
o Lavatory
e Sink (bar; kitchen, domestic with or without dishwasher; laundry; service or UPC Committee Discussion:
Table 610.3 mop basin; washup, each set up faucets Reject Motion to accept failed based on a vote of 6 yes
e  Shower, per head to 18 no. Motion to reject was approved by
e  Water Closet, 1.6 GPF Gravity Tank consent. Concern was noted related to
e  Water Closet, 1.6 GPF Flushometer Tank adequate filling and time related to a reduction
in size.
2 Nominal tubing size 3/8 shall be permitted to be used where hydraulic
calculations support the use of this size.
Update following appliance name in Table 610.3 — Water Supply Fixture Units and ASA Position:
.. . . . Support
Minimum Fixture Branch Pipe Sizes:
Table 610.3 Accept . . .
Nonwater Urinal with Drain Cleansing Action ° UPC Committee Discussion:
Motion to accept as submitted passed based on
consent.
701.2 Drainage Piping. Materials for drainage piping shall be in accordance with
Section 701 one of the referenced standards Reject ASA Position:

n Table 701.2 except that:

20| Page

Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
Oppose. Flexible trap would be in violation of
(7) Flexible trap assemblies meeting the IAPMO IGC 361 listing are permissible for 1004.2. Disinfection not applicable to all classes
all applications in Table 702.1 where the trap is directly accessible. of occupancies.
701.3.3 Type. Fittings used for drainage shall be of the drainage type, have a UPC Committee Discussion:
smooth interior water-way except for Section 701.2 (7) applications, and be Motion to reject due to lack of smooth waterway
constructed to allow 1/4 inch per foot (20.8 mm/m) grade. in the fitting and additional requirements may be
best suited in hospital setting. Rejected by
701.8 Disinfection. Drainage pipe between a water fixture and trap should be consent approval.
disinfected as necessary using Centers for Disease Control guidelines to help
prevent the spread of infectious diseases that can live in these areas. Drain
applications in clinical settings shall use a trap system that allows for regular
disinfection.
Add definition:
Bathroom Group. Any combination of fixtures, not to exceed one water closet, two
lavatories, either one bathtub or one combination bath/shower, and one shower, and ASA Position:
may include a bidet and an emergency floor drain. Neutral
Definitions Half Group. A group of fixtures located together for use by a single occupant consisting .
175 Reject . . .
and DFUs of a water closet and lavatory. UPC Committee Discussion:
Motion to reject passed based on 12 yes, to 11
Proposal adds specific Drainage Fixture Unit Values for various types of “half group” no and 1 abstention.
bathroom groups.
ASA Position:
Support
Add following to 705.6.2 Solvent Cement Joints. “Two-step joining methods shall be in
177 705.6.2 accordance with ASTM D2855.” Reject UPC Committee Discussion:
Motion to reject as noted in previous proposals
under Chapter 6. Passed by consent approval.
706.0 Changes in Direction or Drainage Flow. ASA Position:
180 Section 706 Reject Neutral

706.2 Horizontal to Vertical. Horizontal drainage lines, connecting with a vertical
stack, shall enter through 45 degree (0.79 rad) wye branches, 60 degree (1.05 rad) wye

UPC Committee Discussion:

21| Page

Form Revision

- 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

e

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
branches, combination wye and one-eighth bend branches, double fixture fittings, Motion to reject since the fitting is only designed
sanitary tee or sanitary tapped tee branches, or ....... for back to back systems.
ASA Position:
Neutral
(4) An approved type of two-way cleanout fitting or field made double wye (wye UP,C Commltteg D|§cu55|on: o
181 Section 707.4 and 1/8 bend fitting) in a back to back configuration, installed Reject Reject since a field installed combination fitting
- ! would be installed in reverse. Some noted that it
is not an uncommon practice but the text is not
written well. Motion passed by consent.
707.0 Cleanouts.
ASA Position:
707.4 Location. Each horizontal drainage pipe shall be provided with a cleanout at its Neutral
upper terminal, and each run of piping, that is more than 100 feet (30 480 mm) in total
developed length, shall be provided with a cleanout for each 100 feet (30 480 mm), or UPC Committee Discussion:
182 Section 707 fraction thereof, in length of such piping. An additional cleanout shall be provided in a Reject Motion to accept as submitted. Edit was made to
drainage line for each aggregate horizontal change in direction exceeding 135 degrees change “toilets” to “water closets”. Motion to
(2.36 rad). A cleanout shall be installed above the fixture eennectionfitting flood rim accept failed with a vote of 12 yes to 13 no.
serving each urinal or battery of toiltes regardless of the location of the urinal or Move to reject based on adding additional clean
battery of toilets in the building. outs without justification. Motion to reject
passed by consent.
ASA Position:
Add following new item under 707.4, Cleanouts — Location Neutral
Section . . . .
183 707.4.1 707.4.1 Load Rated Cover. Cleanout floor Covers and top rims meant to take Accept UPC Committee Discussion:
loads shall be rated for the loading in accordance with ASME A112.36.2M. Motion to accept as submitted. Motion passed
based on consent.
ASA Position:
184 Section 708 Revise following section under 708 — Grade of Horizontal Piping. Reject Neutral
UPC Committee Discussion:

22| Page

Form Revision

- 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

e

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
708.1 General. Horizental-drainage Building drain piping shall be run in practical Motion to reject because it would only apply to
alignment and a uniform slope of not less than % inch per foot (20.8 mm/m) or 2 building drains. Motion passed by consent.
percent toward the point of disposal. provided-thatwhere
Exception: Where it is impractical due to the depth of the street sewer, te-the
structural features, or te the arrangement of a building or structure to obtain a slope
of % inch per foot (20.8 mm/m) or 2 percent, such-pipe-or building drain piping 4
inches (100 mm) or larger in diameter shall be permitted to have a slope of not less
than 1/8 inch per foot (10.4 mm/m) or 1 percent, where first approved by the
Authority Having Jurisdiction.
Revised following under 708 — Grade Horizontal Draining Piping, 708.1, General: ASA Position:
Neutral
... pipe or piping 4 5 inches (200 127 mm) or larger in diameter shall be permitted to
have a slope of not less than 1/8 in per foot or 1 %, where approved by the Authority UPC Committee Discussion:
Having Motion to modify to remove deletion of the 4”
185 Section 708 Jurisdiction. Accept as and note will remain. The addition of footnote 5
— Modified to the 4” horizontal pipe will be removed. The
Revise Table 703.2, Maximum Unit Loading and Maximum Length of Drainage and Vent only change left is to footnote 4 allowing for
Piping to delete footnote 5 for 4 in horizontal drainage piping and revise footnote 4 to “six”. Motion to accept as modified passed 17
state “Not to exceed five six water closets or five six-unit traps. yes to 5 no. Some concern was raised about lack
of justification of the six urinals on a 3“ line.
718.0 Grade, Support, and Protection of Building Sewers.
718.1 Slope. Building sewers shall be run in practical alignment and at a uniform slope
of not less than % inch per foot (20.8 mm/m) toward the point of disposal.
Exception: Where approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction and where it is ASA Position:
impractical, due to the depth of the street sewer, erte the structural features or the '
. arrangement of a building or structure, to obtain a slope of % inch per foot (20.8 Neutral
197 Section 718 Accept

mm/m), sueh-pipe-er piping 4 inches (100 mm) through 6 inches (150 mm) shall be
permitted to have a slope of not less than 1/8 inch per foot (10.4 mm/m) and such
piping 8 inches (200 mm) and larger shall be permitted to have a slope of not less than
1/16 inch per foot (5.2 mm/m). The maximum and minimum fixture unit loading shall
be in accordance with Table 717.1.

UPC Committee Discussion:
Motion to accept passed based on consent.

23| Page

Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

urinals, drinking fountains, dental units, and similar fixtures shall be of standard
design, weight and shall be of ABS, cast-brass, cast-iron, lead, PP, PVC, or other
approved material.

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
Revise footnote 2 for Table 1002.2 Horizontal Lengths of Trap Arms (Except Water ASA Position:
Closets and Similar Fixtures) Neutral
Table 1002.2 2The developed length between the trap of a water closet or similar fixture . Approve UPC Committee Discussion:
(measured from the tep face of the closet flange to the inner edge of the vent) and its . :
vent shall not exceed 6 fe?(lszg mm). Motion to aCCept. Motion paSSed based on
consent approval.
Add footnote 3 for Table 1002.2 Horizontal Lengths of Trap Arms (Except Water Closets "
and Similar Fixtures) ASA Position:
Neutral
Table 1002.2 3Horizontally wet vented bathtubs, showers and similar fixtures shall be limited to a Reject
' maximum of 6 feet (1830 mm) for 1-1/2 inch (40 mm) fixture drains and 8 feet UPC Committee Discussion:
(2440 mm) for 2 inch (50 mm) fixture drains, maintaining % inch per foot slope (20 Motion to reject. The motion passed with a vote
mm/m). of 14 yes to 9 no.
1003.0 Traps — Described
1003.1 General Requirements. Each trap, except for traps within an interceptor or
similar device shall be self-cleaning. Traps for bathtubs, showers, lavatories, sinks,
laundry tubs, floor drains, urinals, drinking fountains, dental units, and similar ASA Position:
fixtures shall be of standard design, weight and shall be of ABS, cast-brass copper ) o
. . ’ Opposed. Movement of the objection into the
alloy, cast-iron, lead, PP, PVC, or other approved material. An exposed and readily
. . . body goes beyond drawn-copper alloy.
. accessible drawn-copper alloy tubing trap, not less than 17 B & S Gauge (0.045 inch) .
Section 1003 . . . . . Reject
(1.143 mm), shall be permitted to be used on fixtures discharging domestic sewage. . . .
£ . 5 . : . UPC Committee Discussion:
: - Each trap Motion to reject. Motion passed based on
shall have the manufacturer’s name stamped legibly in the metal of the trap, and JE— rjova.l P
each tubing trap shall have the gauge of the tubing in addition to the manufacturer’s PP ’
name. A trap shall have a smooth and uniform interior waterway.
Exception: Drawn-copper alloy tubing traps shall not be used for urinals.
1003.0 Traps — Described ASA Position:
1003.1 General Requirements. Each trap, except for traps within an interceptor or Opposed. Movement of the objection into the
similar device, shall be self-cleaning. Traps shall have a smooth and uniform interior body goes beyond drawn-copper alloy.
Section 1003 waterway. Traps for bathtubs, showers, lavatories, sinks, laundry tubs, floor drains, Reject

UPC Committee Discussion:
Motion to reject. Motion passed based on
consent approval.

24| Page

Form Revision

- 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
An exposed and readily accessible drawn-copper alloy tubing trap, not less than 17 B
& S Gauge (0.045 inch) (1.143 mm), shall be permitted to be used on fixtures
discharging domestic sewage.
Each trap shall have the manufacturer’s name and gauge or schedule legibly stamped
on the trap.
Exception: Drawn-copper alloy tubing traps shall not be used for urinals. Each-trap
ASA Position:
Neutral
Section 1500 Significant revisions to Sections under Section 1500 related to gray water systems. Reject UPC Committee Decision:
Motion to reject based on unenforceable
language and setting requirements while not
requiring a permit. Motion passed based on a
consent vote.
CHAPTER 15 - ALTERNATE WATER SOURCES FOR NONPOTABLE APPLICATIONS
1501.7 Minimum Water Quality Requirements. The minimum water quality for
alternate water source systems shall meet the applicable water quality requirements ASA Position:
for the intended application as determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction. In the Neutral
absence of water quality requirements, for on-site treated nonpotable systems, the
water quality requirements of EPA/600/R-12/618-2012, IAPMO IGC 324 or NSF 350 UPC Committee Discussion:
Chapters 15 shall apply. MLERL 0400 capininsracamariendes wakerrarse-pidaling Approve as Motion to modify that removes EPA guideline as
and 16 assistregulatorya Modified a requirement and leave as a guideline. NSF
gualitystandards: expressed concern about including IAPMO IGC
324. Motion to modify (leaving IAPMO reference
CHAPTER 16 - NONPOTABLE RAINWATER CATCHMENT SYSTEMS in) passed with a vote of 18 yes, 1 no and 3
1603.5 Minimum Water Quality. The minimum water quality for harvested abstentions
rainwater shall meet the applicable water quality requirements for the intended
applications as determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction. In the absence of
25| Page Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

S

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE

Item #

Section(s)

Summary of Proposed Revision

UPCTC
Position

Comments

water quality requirements determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction, the
minimum treatment and water quality shall be in accordance with Table 1603.5,
EPA/600/R-12/618-2012, IAPMO IGC 324 or NSF 350.

Exception: No treatment is required for rainwater used for subsurface or
nonsprinkled surface irrigation where the maximum storage volume is less
than 360 gallons (1363 L).

Section 1505

1505.0 Reclaimed (Recycled) Water Systems.

1505.5 Water Pressure. Reclaimed (recycled) water systems supplying water to
water closets, urinals, and trap primers shall be capable of delivering not less than
15 pounds-force per square inch (psi) (103 kPa) residual pressure at the highest
and most remote outlet served. Where the water pressure in the reclaimed water
supply system within the building exceeds 80 psi (552 kPa), a press re reducing
valve reducing the pressure to 80 psi (552 kPa) or less to water outlets in the
building shall be installed.

Accept

ASA Position:
Neutral

UPC Committee Discussion:
Motion to accept passed based on consent

approval.

(Note: see comments under 262)

N
iy

Section 1506

1506.0 On-Site Treated Nonpotable Water Systems.
1506.1 General. The provisions of this section shall ap
alteration, and repair of onsite treated nonpotable water systems intended to
supply uses such as water closets, urinals, trap primers for floor drains and floor
sinks, above and belowground irrigation, industrial or commercial cooling or air
conditioning, and other uses approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction.
Nonpotable water sources that shall be permitted for collection for re-use
in on-site treated nonpotable water systems, include rainwater, air conditioner
condensate, cooling tower blow-down water, fire pump test water, foundation
drainage, swimming pool backwash, steam system condensate, fluid cooler
discharge water, ice maker discharge water, food steamer discharge water,
combination oven discharge water, industrial process water, and other sources
approved by _the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

Reject

ASA Position:
Neutral

UPC Committee Discussion:
Motion to reject since the “laundry list” may not
be all inclusive.

26| Page

Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

S

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
1506.0 On-Site Treated Nonpotable Water Systems.
1506.5 Water Pressure. On-site treated non-potable water systems supplying ASA Position:
water to water closets, urinals, and trap primers shall be capable of delivering Neutral
not less than 15 pounds-force per square inch (psi) (103 kPa) residual pressure at
262 Section 1506 the highest and most remote outlet served. Where the water pressure in the on- Accept UPC Committee Discussion:
site treated non-potable water supply system within the building exceeds 80 psi Concerns raised reIatfed to othgr sections of the
(552 kPa), a pressure reducing valve reducing the pressure to 80 psi (552 kPa) or code already addressing. Motion to accept
less to water outlets in the building shall be installed. passed based on consent approval
ASA Position
Neutral
. . . UPC Committee Discussion
264 Chapter 15 Adds new section 1507.0 Onsite Blackwater Treatment Systems. Reject . ! . 1scussi .
Motion to reject passed based on understanding
the proposal would be better suited for an
Appendix.
ASA Position
Neutral
UPC C ittee Di i
265 Chapter 15 Adds new section 1508.0 Onsite Stormwater Treatment Systems Reject . ommi .ee iscussion .
Motion to reject passed based on understanding
the proposal would be better suited for an
Appendix.
ASA Position
Neutral
. Adds new Section L404.0 Non-Sewered Sanitation Systems in Appendix L, Sustainable . UPC Committee Discussion
287 Appendix L Reject

Practices.

Motion to reject based on the acceptance of
item 306. Motion accepted based on consent
approval.

27| Page

Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

e

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
ASA Position
Neutral
UPC Committee Discussion
N . . . . . e Motion to reject. No test requirement for “zero
Significant revisions to sections L402 Water-Conserving Plumbing Fixtures and Fittings ” . . .
. . .- . . . leakage”; 406.6.3.1 markings is overly restrictive
288 Appendix L and L404 Occupancy Specific Water Efficiency Requirements and other Sections of Reject . .
Appendix L and marking requirements are already covered
PP ’ in the product standards; exception Table 407
for pools/spas overly restrictive. Motion to
reject passed with a vote of 13 yes to 8 no
Revise footnote 1 to Table L402.1 Maximum Fixture and Fixture Fittings Flow Rates ASA Position
Neutral
292 Appendix L 1 Shall be listed to EPA WatersSense Specification for Showerheads. For multiple Approve
showerheads serving one shower compartment see Section L 402.6.1. UPC Committee Discussion
Approve
Revise footnote 2 to Table L 402.1 Maximum Fixture and Fixture Fittings Flow Rates ASA Position
Neutral
293 Appendix L 2 Shall be listed to EPA WaterSense Specification for Tank-Type Toilet or Specification Approve
for Flushometer-Valve Water Closets. UPC Committee Discussion
Approve
Add footnote 5 to Table L 402.1 Maximum Fixture and Fixture Fittings Flow Rates ASA Position
related to “lavatory faucets residential” Neutral
294 Appendix L Approve
5 Shall be listed to EPA WaterSense High-Efficiency Lavatory Faucet Specification. UPC Committee Discussion
Approve
L 402.8 Commercial Pre-Rinse Spray Valves. The flow rate for a pre-rinse spray valve ASA Position
installed in a commercial kitchen to remove food waste from cookware and dishes Neutral
before cleaning shall not be more than 1-28-gpm-{4-8-L/m)-at 60-psi{414-kPa) the
. maximum flow rate, as specified in Table L 402.8. Where pre-rinse spray valves with UPC Committee Discussion
295 Appendix L . . . Approve . .
maximum flow rates of 1.0 gpm (3.8 L/m) or less are installed, the static pressure shall Motion to accept; It was pointed out the
be not less than 30 psi (207 kPa). Commercial kitchen pre-rinse spray valves shall be proposal brings text in line with existing Federal
equipped with integral automatic shutoff. Pre-rinse-spray-valvesshall-belisted-to the Law. Motion approved based on a consent vote.
28| Page Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -

I UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings
UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
TABLE L 402.8
COMMERCIAL PRE-RINSE SPRAY VALVE MAXIMUM FLOW RATE
PRODUCT CLASS BY SPRAY FORCE MAXIMUM FLOW RATE
(GPM)
Product Class 1 (</= 5.0 ounces-force) 1.00
Product Class 2 (> 5.0 ounces-force 1.20
and </= 8.0 ounces-force)
Product Class 3 (> 8.0 ounces-force) 1.28
For Sl units: 1 gallon per minute = 3.785 L/min, 1 ounce-force = 0.0625 pound-force
L 402.0 Water-Conserving Plumbing Fixtures and Fittings. ﬁiﬁtl::lsmon
L 402.8 Bath and Shower Flow-Reduction Devices. Bath and shower flow-
296 Appendix L :ZsuMchgéjnges shall comply with Approve UPC Discussion
—_— Motion to accept approved based on consent.
ASA Position
. Neutral
. Add reference to ASSE 1086 to L410.3 POU Reverse Osmosis Water Treatment
300 Appendix L Svst Approve
ystems. UPC Discussion
Motion to accept approved by consent vote.
ASA Position
Neutral
305 Appendix N Significant revisions throughout Appendix N Impact of Water Temperature on the Approve

Potential for Scalding and Legionella Growth.

UPC Discussion
Motion to accept. Concern with the moving
from the current table to the graphic

29| Page

Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

e

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE
UPCTC Comments
Item # Section(s) Summary of Proposed Revision Position
representation and some concern with technical
correctness. Motion approved by consent.
ASA Position
Neutral
. . . . o A d . .
306 Appendix O New Appendix specifically covering Non-Sewered Sanitation Systems pprO\./(? as UPC Discussion
Modified . -
Motion to approve as modified to remove the
“exception statement”. Motion accepted based
on consent approval.
ASA Position
Neutral
UPC Discussion
308-319 Appendix Q Proposals provide guidance on the safe operation, closure and reopening of building Reject Motion to reje.ct all items ba§ed on the fact that
I water systems some content is currently going through a peer
review process and it will be coming back in
public comment. Motion approved by consent
approval.
ASA Position
Neutral
UPC Discussion
. . . . Motion to reject all it based on the fact that
320-23 Appendix Q New Appendix covering nonpotable water systems Reject otonto I’EJE-C all tems a.?e on the fact tha
A some content is currently going through a peer
review process and it will be coming back in
public comment. Motion approved by consent
approval.
Approve as ASA Position
324 Appendix R New Appendix on Tiny Houses Modified Neutral

30| Page

Form Revision — 5/14/21




ASA

AMERICAN SUPPLY ASSOCIATION

S

ASA Plumbing Fixture and Appliance Code Committee -
UPC TC Meeting Notes from May 3 thru 7, 2021 Hearings

UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE

Item #

Section(s)

Summary of Proposed Revision

UPCTC
Position

Comments

UPC Discussion

Motion to approve as modified based on a
significant amount of modification. Motion was
withdrawn and new motion to reject accepted
by consent.

w
N
(O, ]

Appendix S

New Appendix for Composting Toilet and Urine Diversion Systems

Reject

ASA Position
Neutral

UPC Discussion

Motion to reject based on insufficient
justification for adding to UPC as an Appendix
and should remain in WeStand.

31| Page

Form Revision — 5/14/21




o

2021

UPC® TECHNICAL
COMMITTEE MEETING

MONOGRAPH

VIRTUAL MEETING | MAY 3 -7,2021




Proposals

Item #: 009
UPC 2024 Section: 206.0

SUBMITTER: Bruce A Pfeiffer
Retired - City of Topeka

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

2060 -D-

Dead Leg. Section of potable water pipe which contains water that has no flow or does not circulate. Pipe lengths
equal to, or greater than 1.5 times the diameter of the pipe constitutes a dead leg.

SUBSTANTIATION:
Defining the length of a dead leg will eliminate interpretation issues between the installer and AHJ.

10


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 011
UPC 2024 Section: 206.0, 209.0

SUBMITTER: Garry Sato
Greensmart Sustainable Concepts

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

2060 -D-

Diverter Valve, Gray Water Biverter-Valve. A valve that directs gray water to the sanitary drainage system or a
subsurface irrigation system.

Diverter Valve, On Site Treated Nonpotable Water. A key component in the collection system to control inflow and
overflow in collection tanks intended for on-site treatment and direct beneficial use.

Diverter Valve, Rainwater. A key component in commercial rainwater catchment systems to control high inflow and
overflow volumes in rainwater storage tanks.

2090 -G-

Gray Water. Untreated wastewater that has not come into contact with toilet waste, kitchen sink waste, dishwasher
waste or similarly contaminated sources. Gray water includes, but not limited to, wastewater from bathtubs, showers,
lavatories, clothes washers, and laundry tubs. Also known as grey water, graywater, and greywater.

SUBSTANTIATION:

The intent is to define new items that fill an unmet need and to clarify their specific uses that previously did not exist
in the industry with regards to water sustainability. There are now existing regulations that require certain
sustainable water practices that were not mentioned in previous code editions that require greater conformity and
definition.

12


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 013
UPC 2024 Section: 208.0

SUBMITTER: Phillip H Ribbs
PHR Consultants

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

2080 -F-
Flood-Level Rim. The top edge of a receptor or fixture from which water overflows.

(below shown for reference only)

Receptor. An approved plumbing fixture or device of such material, shape, and capacity as to adequately receive the
discharge from indirect waste pipes, so constructed and located as to be readily cleaned.

Air Break. A physical separation which may be a low inlet into the indirect waste receptor from the fixture, appliance, or
device indirectly connected.

Air Gap, Drainage. The unobstructed vertical distance through the free atmosphere between the lowest opening from a
pipe, plumbing fixture, appliance, or appurtenance conveying waste to the flood-level rim of the receptor.

Area Drain. A receptor designed to collect surface or storm water from an open area.

Critical Level. The critical level (C-L or C/L) marking on a backflow prevention device or vacuum breaker is a point
conforming to approved standards and established by the testing laboratory (usually stamped on the device by the
manufacturer) that determines the minimum elevation above the flood-level rim of the fixture or receptor served at which
the device may be installed. Where a backflow prevention device does not bear a critical level marking, the bottom of
the vacuum breaker, combination valve, or the bottom of such approved device shall constitute the critical level.

SUBSTANTIATION:

As currently written, the term “flood-level rims” is limited to “receptors” which seems like an oversight in the
language. The term “flood-level rim” applies to water closets, urinals and other fixtures that are not considered a
receptor. The simple addition of “or fixture” will clarify the intended use for flood-level rims and not just limit it to a
receptor.

14


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 017
UPC 2024 Section: 212.0

SUBMITTER: Donald (DJ) Berger
Self

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

2120 -J-

Joint, Press-Conneect Elastomeric. A permanentmeehanicat removable or non-removable joint incorporating an
elastomerlc seal oran elastomerlc seal and corrosmn re3|stant grlp ring. Fhejointis-made-with-a-pressing-tootandjaw

SUBSTANTIATION:

The word “Press-Connect” describes one type of technology using elastomeric materials for the joint seal. By
revising the definition with the word “Elastomeric.” This definition may be expanded to include similar joining
technologies employing an elastomeric material for its seal. E.g., push-fit, grooved (Victaulic), bolted (Dresser),
compression repair couplings, etc.

The words “permanent mechanical” are inconsistent with other “permanent” and “mechanical” joint definitions within
this section of the code. By revising the definition with the removal of the phrase “The joint is made with a pressing
tool and jaw or ring that complies with the manufacturer’s installation instructions,” the definition would be inclusive
of similar joining technologies employing elastomeric materials. This revision would provide additional consistency
within the code as the 2021 UPC has specific sections that provide information on how joints are to be made.

18


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 018
UPC 2024 Section: 214.0

SUBMITTER: John Taecker
UL LLC

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

2140 -L-

Listed (Third Party Certified). Equipment or materials included in a list published by a listing agency (accredited
conformity assessment body) that maintains periodic inspection of current production of listed equipment or materials
and whose listing states either that the equipment or material complies with approved standards or has been tested and
found suitable for use in a specified manner. Terms used to identify listed equipment, products, or materials include
“listed,” “certified,” or other terms as determined appropriate by the listing_ agency.

SUBSTANTIATION:

The proposed revision to the definition for “Listed” recognizes that listing organizations may use other terms to
identify “listed” equipment, products, or materials. An example of other terms used that meet the definition of “listed”
include “certified.” The term “certified” is a more globally recognized term used by listing organizations compared to
the term “listed.”

19


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 021
UPC 2024 Section: 218.0

SUBMITTER: Bruce A Pfeiffer
Retired - City of Topeka

RECOMMENDATION:
Add new text

2180 -P-

Public Use Occupancy. Commercial buildings that include, but are not limited to office buildings, retail stores,
restaurants, industrial, multi-family_housing, hotels, motels, arenas, stadiums, and other structures not used for one and
two family dwellings.

SUBSTANTIATION:

There is no definition for the term "public use occupancy" in the Code. That term is used in Section 710.9 and
Section 1101.14 of the 2021 UPC to require multiple pumps for sanitary and storm water wastes. Defining the term
"public use occupancy" gives the user a clearer understanding of when two pumps would be needed.

22


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 026
UPC 2024 Section: 224.0

SUBMITTER: Chris Sweeny
Specification Sales

RECOMMENDATION:
Add new text

2240 -V-

Valve, Balancing. A valve that regulates and controls the return of hot water to the water heater in a recirculating
potable or nonpotable hot water piping_system to ensure that specified hot water temperatures are delivered to all point-
of-use fixtures within specified time frames or volumes. These include the following:

(1)_Flow Balancing Valve with Memory Stop. Includes globe valve, needle valve, or venturi valve design with ports for
reading temperature and pressure, knob adjustment with graduated set-point markings, and lockable memory setting.
(2)_Preset Automatic Flow Control Valve. A fixed orifice valve regulates flow by using_a spring mechanism to maintain a
specified flow over a variety of pressures. These function with replaceable flow cartridges, each having a different flow
rate orifice assembly and with different pressure differentials.

(3)_Thermostatic Flow Regulating Valve. Mechanical thermostatically controlled valves that automatically self-adjust
return water flow to maintain specified temperatures in the hot water circuits.

SUBSTANTIATION:

What exactly is a domestic hot water (DHW) balancing valve? Despite code enhancements and increased
emphasis around domestic hot water design, a critical component of any DHW recirculation system has gone
largely unaddressed. Due to the lack of a definition of a balancing valve, any valve that regulates flow can
theoretically be used in a DHW recirculation system, including a ball valve. The addition of a clear definition of what
a balancing valve is will allow plumbing designers to require a balancing valve designed and intended for use in
DHW recirculation systems.

27



angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 028
UPC 2024 Section: 225.0

SUBMITTER: Bob Adler
Self

RECOMMENDATION:
Add new text

2250 -W-

Water Station. A designated location intended to provide access to drinking water through a device or appliance.

SUBSTANTIATION:
The term “water station” is used in the code and not currently defined. This definition will assist the end user to the
intent of the term and how it will apply to the section and note of the UPC.

29


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 030
UPC 2024 Section: 301.3

SUBMITTER: Phillip H Ribbs
PHR Consultants

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

301.0 General.

301.3 Alternate Materials and Methods of Construction Equivalency. Unless specifically prohibited, Nnothing in this
code is intended to prevent the use of systems, methods, or devices of equivalent or superior quality, strength, fire
resistance, effectiveness, durability, and safety over those prescribed by this code. Technical documentation shall be
submitted to the Authority Having Jurisdiction to demonstrate equivalency prior to installation. The Authority Having
Jurisdiction shall have the authority to approve or disapprove the system, method, or device for the intended purpose.

However, the exercise of this discretionary approval by the Authority Having Jurisdiction shall have no effect
beyond the jurisdictional boundaries of said Authority Having Jurisdiction. An alternate material or method of
construction so approved shall not be considered as in accordance with the requirements, intent, or both of this code for
a purpose other than that granted by the Authority Having Jurisdiction where the submitted data does not prove
equivalency.

SUBSTANTIATION:

Section 301.3 grants authority to AHJ’s to approve materials or products at their discretion. However, Section 301.3
places an obligation on the AHJ to approve only those alternate materials or products which comply “with the intent
of this code,” which are “at least the equivalent of that prescribed in this code,” and are not specifically prohibited
elsewhere in the code.

32


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 034
UPC 2024 Section: 309.6

SUBMITTER: Bruce A Pfeiffer
Retired - City of Topeka

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

309.0 Workmanship.

309.6 Dead Legs. Dead legs shall have a method of flushing. The maximum length of a dead leg shall be not more than

1.5 times the diameter of the branch pipe.
(below is shown for reference only)
2090 -G-

Dead Leg. A section of potable water pipe which contains water that has no flow or does not circulate.

SUBSTANTIATION:
These new guidelines are recommended by industry experts for Legionella and bacteria control in potable water
systems. Currently there are no restrictions in the Code on the length of pipe for a dead leg.

36


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 035
UPC 2024 Section: 310.1

SUBMITTER: Bruce A Pfeiffer
Retired - City of Topeka

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

310.0 Prohibited Fittings and Practices.

310.1 Fittings. No double hub fitting, single or double tee branch, single or double tapped tee branch, side inlet quarter

bend, running thread, band, or saddle shall be used as a drainage fitting.;-exceptthat-a-deuble-hub-sanitary-tappedtee
shall-be-permittedto-beused-on-a-verticaHine-as-a-fixture-connection:

SUBSTANTIATION:
According to representatives of the Cast Iron Soil Pipe Institute (CISPI), the double hub sanitary tapped tee has not
been made for 75 years. The reference to this fitting needs to be removed from the Code.

37


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 046
UPC 2024 Section: 402.6

SUBMITTER: Bob Adler
Self

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

402.0 Installation.

402.6 Flanged Fixture Connections. Fixture connections between drainage pipes and water closets, floor outlet
service sinks and urinals shall be made using an approved copper alloy, hard lead, ABS, PVC, or iron flanges caulked,
soldered, solvent cemented; rubber compression gaskets; or screwed to the drainage pipe. The connection shall be
bolted with an approved gasket, washer, or setting compound between the fixture and the connection. The bottom of the
flange shall be set on an approved firm base.

Wall-mounted water closet fixtures shall be securely bolted to the structure with an approved carrier fitting. The
connecting pipe between the carrier fitting and the fixture shall be an approved material and designed to accommodate
an adequately sized gasket. Gasket material shall be neoprene, felt, or similar approved types.

SUBSTANTIATION:
It might go without saying but the carrier needs to be secured to the structure. The added text will ensure that the
flange is secured to the structure as directed by the manufacturer.

48


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 047
UPC 2024 Section: 402.6, Table 1701.1, Table 1701.2

SUBMITTER: Karan Kapila
Self

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

402.0 Installation.

402.6 Flanged Fixture Connections. Fixture connections between drainage pipes and water closets, floor outlet
service sinks and urinals shall be made using an approved copper alloy, hard lead, ABS, PVC, or iron flanges caulked,
soldered solvent cemented; rubber compressron gaskets or screwed to the dramage pipe. The-connection-shalt-be
v v ior- The waste
connect|on shaII be Jomed with an aoproved elastomenc gasket, flanqe to frxture connector complying with ASME
A112.4.3 or an approved setting compound. The bottom of the flange shall be set on an approved firm base.
Wall-mounted water closet fixtures shall be securely bolted to an approved carrier fitting. The connecting pipe
between the carrier fitting and the fixture shall be an approved material and designed to accommodate an adequately
sized gasket. Gasket material shall be neoprene, felt, or similar approved types.

TABLE 1701.1
REFERENCED STANDARDS
STANDARD REFERENCED

NUMBER STANDARD TITLE APPLICATION SECTION

Plastic Fittings for Connecting Water
Closets to the Sanitary Drainage Fittings 402.6
System

ASME A112.4.3-
1999(R2019)

(portions of table not shown remain unchanged)

Note: ASME A112.4.3 meets the requirements for a mandatory referenced standard in accordance with Section
3-3.7.1 of IAPMO's Regulations Governing Committee Projects.

TABLE 1701.2
STANDARDS, PUBLICATIONS, PRACTICES, AND GUIDES

DOCUMENT TITLE APPLICATION

DOCUMENT
NUMBER

1999(R2615) Brainage-System thgs

(portions of table not shown remain unchanged)

SUBSTANTIATION:

This change will add the appropriate standard for plastic water closet fittings for connecting a water closet to the
sanitary drainage system. These connections are a safety issue, and the addition of this standard will add clarity
and direction for the end user.

49


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 048
UPC 2024 Section: 402.6

SUBMITTER: Bruce A Pfeiffer
Retired - City of Topeka

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

402.0 Installation.

402.6 Flanged Fixture Connections. Fixture connections between drainage pipes and water closets, floor outlet
service sinks and urinals shall be made using an approved copper alloy, hard lead, ABS, PVC, or iron flanges
caulked, soldered, solvent cemented; rubber compression gaskets; or screwed to the drainage pipe. The connection
shall be bolted with an approved gasket, washer, or setting compound between the fixture and the connection. The
bottom of the flange shall be set on-anapproved-firm-base_the top of the finished floor.

Wall-mounted water closet fixtures shall be securely bolted to an approved carrier fitting. The connecting pipe
between the carrier fitting and the fixture shall be an approved material and designed to accommodate an
adequately sized gasket. Gasket material shall be neoprene, felt, or similar approved types.

SUBSTANTIATION:

This Code section allows a water closet flange to be set on the subfloor (approved firm base) which would require
the use of multiple closet wax rings to create a water tight seal between the fixture and flange. The installation
instructions by manufacturers is to install the flange so the bottom of the flange rests on the finished floor. This
installation requires only a single bowl wax to create a water tight seal.

50


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 049
UPC 2024 Section: 402.6.1, 402.6.3

SUBMITTER: Bob Adler
Self

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

402.0 Installation.

402.6.1 Closet Rings (Closet Flanges). Closet rings (closet flanges) for water closets or similar fixtures shall be of an
approved type and shall be copper alloy, copper, hard lead, cast-iron, galvanized malleable iron, ABS, PVC, or other
approved materials. Each-sueh The closet ring (closet flange) shall be approximately 7 inches (178 mm) in diameter
and, where installed, shall, together with the soil pipe, presenta 1 1/2 inch (38 mm) wide flange or face to receive the
fixture gasket or closet seal.

Caulked-on closet rings (closet flanges) shall be not less than 1/4 of an inch (6.4 mm) thick and not less than 2
inches (51 mm) in overall depth.

Closet rings (closet flanges) shall be burned or soldered to lead bends or stubs, shall be caulked to cast-iron soil
pipe, shall be solvent cemented to ABS and PVC, and shall be screwed or fastened in an approved manner to other
materials.

feug#rnspeeheﬂﬂs—eatted- Where the closet ring_is mstalled on the closet bend or riser, the flnlshed joint shall be present
a smooth surface flush with the top of the closet ring.

Closet rings (closet flanges) shall be adequately designed with the bottom of the ring_or flange positioned on the
finished floor and secured to support fixtures connected thereto.

Offset closet rings (closet flanges)_shall be free of ledges and corners that would obstruct flow shall be permitted
for floor discharge water closets.

402.6.3 Securing Floor-Mounted, Back-Outlet Water Closet Bowls. Floor-mounted, back-outlet water closet bowls
shall be set level with an angle of 90 degrees (1.57 rad) between the floor and wall at the centerline of the fixture outlet.
The floor and wall shall have a flat mounting surface not less than 5 inches (127 mm) to the right and left of the fixture
outlet centerline. The fixture shall be secured to the wall outlet flange or drainage connection and the floor by corrosion
reS|stant screws or bolts. The closet fIange shall be f|rme secured teﬂrmﬂaase Where-floor-mountedback-outlet

i - Offset, eccentric, or reducing

closet flanges shaII not be used bermltted with these f|xtures

SUBSTANTIATION:

For Section 402.6.1:

(Paragraph 4) Since closet flanges (closet flange) are unlikely to be installed, for dozens of reasons, before the
rough inspection is called, that language should be eliminated. It is likely unenforceable because rarely has a
finished floor level been established.

(Paragraph 5) The question has been asked thousands of time as to where the closet flange sets in relation to the
floor. Here it is answered... it is designed to sit on and be securely attached to the “finished floor.” One of the
reasons for the problem in paragraph 2.

(Last paragraph) This is an often asked question which needs a direct answer in the text of the code. The last
paragraph of Section 402.6.3 is sometimes mistakenly used to prevent ANY offset closet ring.

For Section 402.6.3, the proposed language will make the language concise and clarify the intent of the section.
Pipe size is not needed, it is clearly addressed in Tables 702.1 and 703.2.

51


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 050
UPC 2024 Section: 402.6.1

SUBMITTER: Shane Peters
City of Santa Monica

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

402.0 Installation.

402.6 Flanged Fixture Connections. (portions of text not shown remains unchanged)

402.6.1 Closet Rings (Closet Flanges). Closet rings (closet flanges) for water closets or similar fixtures shall be of an
approved type and shall be copper alloy, copper, hard lead, cast-iron, galvanized malleable iron, ABS, PVC, or other
approved materials. Each such closet ring (closet flange) shall be approximately 7 inches (178 mm) in diameter and, where
installed, shall, together with the soil pipe, present a 1 1/2 inch (38 mm) wide flange or face to receive the fixture gasket or
closet seal.

Caulked-on closet rings (closet flanges) shall be not less than 1/4 of an inch (6.4 mm) thick and not less than 2 inches
(51 mm) in overall depth.

Closet bends or stubs shall be cut-off to present a smooth surface even with the top of the closet ring before the rough
inspection is called.

Closet rings (closet flanges) shall be adequately designed and secured to support fixtures connected thereto.

(below shown for reference only)
705.0 Joints and Connections.

SUBSTANTIATION:
Cleans up the language by eliminating all the ways the closet ring or flange shall be joined to the riser and just
references Section 705.0 (Joints and Connections).

52


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 051
UPC 2024 Section: 402.6.1

SUBMITTER: Bruce A Pfeiffer
Retired - City of Topeka

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

402.0 Installation.

402.6 Flanged Fixture Connections. (remaining text unchanged)

402.6.1 Closet Rings (Closet Flanges). Closet rings (closet flanges) for water closets or similar fixtures shall be of an
approved type and shall be copper alloy, copper, hard lead, cast-iron, galvanized malleable iron, ABS, PVC, or other
approved materials. Each such closet ring (closet flange) shall be approximately 7 inches (178 mm) in diameter and,
where installed, shall, together with the soil pipe, present a 11/2 inch (38 mm) wide flange or face to receive the fixture
gasket or closet seal.

Caulked-on closet rings (closet flanges) shall be not less than 1/4 of an inch (6.4 mm) thick and not less than 2
inches (51 mm) in overall depth.

Closet rings (closet flanges) shall be burned or soldered to lead bends or stubs, shall be caulked to cast-iron soil
pipe, shall be solvent cemented to ABS and PVC, and shall be screwed or fastened in an approved manner to other
materials

Closet bends or stubs shall be cut-off to present a smooth surface even with the top of the closet ring before the
rough inspection is called.

Closet rings (closet flanges) shall be adequately designed and secured to support fixtures connected thereto.

Offset,_eccentric, or reducing floor mounted closet flanges that create a ledge or otherwise constrict the full
opening_of the water closet shall not be used.

SUBSTANTIATION:

Currently the Code only addresses the use of offset, eccentric or reducing closet flanges for floor-mounted back-
outlet water closets (see Section 402.6.3). Flanges for all water closets that constrict the full opening of a water
closet into the sanitary waste piping create an obstruction in flow and are not compliant with the Code per Section
310.5. The proposed language reinforces the requirement that closet flanges that causes a restriction in flow,
regardless of if they are floor or wall mounted, are not Code compliant.

53


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 052
UPC 2024 Section: 402.6.3

SUBMITTER: Shane Peters
City of Santa Monica

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

402.0 Installation.

402.6 Flanged Fixture Connections. (remaining text unchanged)

402.6.3 Securing Floor-Mounted, Back-Outlet Water Closet Bowls. Floor-mounted, back-outlet water closet bowls
shall be set level with an angle of 90 degrees (1.57 rad) between the floor and wall at the centerline of the fixture outlet.
The floor and wall shall have a flat mounting surface not less than 5 inches (127 mm) to the right and left of the fixture
outlet centerline. The fixture shall be secured to the wall outlet flange or drainage connection and the floor by corrosion-
resistant screws or bolts. The closet flange shall be secured to a firm base. Offset, eccentric, or reducing_closet flanges
shall not be permitted with these fixtures.

SUBSTANTIATION:

This change is an attempt to be clear and direct. Pipe size is not needed, as it is clearly stated in Table 702.1 and
Table 703.2. The last sentence is moved up and modified to clarify that such offset, eccentric, or reducing closet
flanges should not be permitted with the fixtures mentioned in Section 402.6.3.

54


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 053
UPC 2024 Section: 403.4

SUBMITTER: Ronald L George
Plumb-Tech Design & Consulting Services LLC

RECOMMENDATION:
Add new text

403.0 Accessible Plumbing Facilities.

403.4 Temperature Limits at Accessible Plumbing Fixtures. The maximum water temperature discharging from any
accessible plumbing fixture shall be limited to a maximum of 110°F (43°C)_by one of the methods prescribed in Section

(below shown for reference only)
408.3 Individual Shower and Tub-Shower Combination Control Valves. (remaining text unchanged)

408.3.2 Temperature Limiting. The maximum water temperature discharging from an individual showerhead shall be
limited to 120°F (49°C) by one of the following methods:

(1) A shower or tub/shower combination valve conforming to ASSE 1016/ASME A112.1016/CSA B125.16 where either:
(a) The valve is field-adjusted to the required maximum temperature, or

(b) The handle position, stop, or temperature limiting control is set in accordance with the manufacturer's instructions to
the required maximum temperature.

(2) For gang showers supplied by a single water supply pipe, a mixing valve that conforms to ASSE 1069 that is field-
adjusted to the required maximum temperature.

(3) A limiting device conforming to either ASSE 1070/ASME A112.1070/CSA B125.70 or CSA B125.3.

(4) A water heater conforming to ASSE 1084.

(5) A temperature actuated flow reduction device conforming to ASSE 1062.

SUBSTANTIATION:

Persons using accessible fixtures do not always have feeling or sensation in their body and may be scalded
inadvertently because many disabled people using accessible fixtures cannot feel temperature in their extremities.
Burn Studies by Dr. Moritz & Dr. Henriques at Harvard medical college showed that, at a temperature of 110°F, it
took hours to develop a serious scald burn.

55


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 054
UPC 2024 Section: 404.2 —404.2.2

SUBMITTER: David Mann
CA State Pipe Trades Council

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

404.0 Waste Fittings and Overflows.

404.2 Overflows. Where a fixture is provided with an overflow, the overflow shall comply with Section 404.2.1 and
Section 404.2.2.

404.2.1 Sinks and Bathtubs. {The waste shall be so arranged that the standing water in the fixture shall not rise in the
overflow where the stopper is closed or remain in the overflow where the fixture is empty. The overflow pipe from a

f|xture shaII be connected to the house or |nlet S|de of the flxture trap —exceptthatoverflow-onflushtanks-shall-be

ilt shall be unlawful to connect such

overflows with any other part of the dralnage system
404.2.2 Water Closets and Urinals. Overflows on flush tanks shall be permitted to discharge into the water closets or

urinals served by them.

SUBSTANTIATION:

This section is mixing overflows between sinks, water closets, urinals, and bathtubs all within the same section.
However, there are different types of overflows for these sets of fixtures. The language separates the types of
overflows and relocates the appropriate provision for each. This will clean up the language and add clarity to the
intent.

56


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 055
UPC 2024 Section: 407.1, Table 1701.1

SUBMITTER: Bruce A Pfeiffer
Retired - City of Topeka

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

407.0 Lavatories.

407.1 Application. Lavatories shall comply with ASME A112.19.1/CSA B45.2, ASME A112.19.2/CSA B45.1, ASME
A112.19.3/CSA B45.4, ASME A112.19.12, CSA B45.5/IAPMO Z124, CSA B45.8/IAPMO Z403, CSA B45.11/IAPMO
Z401 or CSA B45.12/IAPMO Z402. Group wash fixtures shall comply with the requirements of Section 401.2 and
IAPMO IGC 156. Every 20 inches (508 mm) of rim space of a group wash fixture shall be considered as one lavatory for
determining the number of lavatories required in accordance with Table 422.1. Lavatory assemblies with automatic soap
dispensers, faucets, or hand dryers shall comply with IAPMO IGC 127.

TABLE 1701.1
REFERENCED STANDARDS

STANDARD REFERENCED
NUMBER STANDARD TITLE APPLICATION SECTION

IAPMO IGC Wash Fountains and Lavatory Systems with or
156-2021 without Water Closets

Miscellaneous 407.1

(portions of table not shown remain unchanged)

Note: IAPMO IGC 156 meets the requirements for a mandatory referenced standard in accordance with Section
3-3.7.1 of IAPMO's Regulations Governing Committee Projects.

SUBSTANTIATION:

The IAPMO IGC 156 standard covers multi faucet assemblies which are a multi-user hand washing plumbing fixture
with a single water supply or single drain. This type of technology is commonly installed in public buildings such as
hospitals, penal facilities, schools, factories, or places of assembly. This standard will assist the consumer and end
user in verifying that such fixture assemblies are compliant with an industry standard.

57


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 056
UPC 2024 Section: 407.7

SUBMITTER: Julius Ballanco, P.E. (JB Engineering and Code Consulting, P.C.; Bradley Corp); Jim Kendzel (ASA)

RECOMMENDATION:
Add new text

407.0 Lavatories.

407.7 Soap Dispenser. Each public lavatory shall have an accompanying_soap dispenser.

SUBSTANTIATION:

The COVID-19 pandemic has identified the importance of washing one’s hand with soap. It is interesting that the
code does not require soap dispensers for public lavatories. However, most engineers and architects specify soap
dispensers. Plumbing contractors install soap dispensers when located in a countertop lavatory. This is an important
health issue that the Plumbing Code must address.

Bibliography:

https://www.rwjf.org/en/blog/2020/03/a-happy-habit-of-healthy-handwashing.html
https://www.cdc.gov/handwashing/when-how-handwashing.html
https://globalhandwashing.org/wp-content/uploads/2020/09/GHD-2020-Fact-Sheet-English.pdf
https://globalhandwashing.org/wp-content/uploads/2020/10/Handwashing-Learning-Brief.pdf
https://globalhandwashing.org/wp-content/uploads/2015/03/Handwashing-Literature-Review_Jan-thru-June-
2013_v2-clean-1.pdf

58


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 057
UPC 2024 Section: 204.0, 408.2

SUBMITTER: Julius Ballanco, P.E.
JB Engineering and Code Consulting, P.C.
Rep. Self

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

408.0 Showers.

408.2 Water Consumption. Showerheads shall have a maximum flow rate of not more than 2.5 gpm at 80 psi (9.5 L/m
at 552 kPa). Body sprays shall have a flow rate for the shower enclosure of not more than 2.5 gpm at 80 psi (9.5 L/m at
552 kPa)

2040 -B-

Body Spray. A shower device for spraying water onto a bather from other than the overhead position.

SUBSTANTIATION:

The U.S. Department of Energy added a definition of body spray to Federal Law regarding water conservation. The
new definition excludes body sprays from the water conservation requirements for showerheads. This change will
add the definition of body spray to Chapter 2. The definition is consistent with the DOE definition. The second part
of the change is to add water conservation requirements for body sprays to the shower section. The water
conservation requirements are the same as the water conservation requirements for showerheads. Body sprays
discharging 2.5 gpm of water provide an adequate amount of water for cleansing while showering. This has been
proven with the years of experience taking showers with showerheads discharging 2.5 gpm.

59


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 058
UPC 2024 Section: 408.2, Table 1701.1, Table 1701.2

SUBMITTER: Bruce A Pfeiffer
Retired - City of Topeka

RECOMMENDATION:
Add new text

408.0 Showers.

408.1 Application. Manufactured shower receptors and shower bases shall comply with ASME A112.19.1/CSA
B45.2, ASME A112.19.2/CSA B45.1, ASME A112.19.3/CSAB45.4, CSA B45.12/IAPMO Z402, or CSA
B45.5/IAPMO Z124. Prefabricated shower enclosures shall comply with IAPMO IGC 154.

408.2 Tileable Shower Receptors. Tileable shower receptors shall comply with CSA B45.5/IAPMO Z124. Field
installed tileable and pre-tiled shower kits shall comply with IAPMO PS 106.

(renumber remaining sections)

TABLE 17011

REFERENCED STANDARDS
STANDARD NUMBER STANDARD TITLE APPLICATION | REFERENCED
SECTION
IAPMO PS 106-2015¢1 | Tileable Shower Receptors and Shower Kits Fixtures 408.2

(portions of table not shown remain unchanged)

Note: CSA B45.5/IAPMO Z124 and IAPMO PS 106 meet the requirements for mandatory referenced standards in
accordance with Section 3-3.7.1 of IAPMO’s Regulations Governing Committee Projects.

TABLE 1701.2
STANDARDS, PUBLICATIONS, PRACTICES, AND GUIDES

DOCUMENT NUMBER DOCUMENT TITLE APPLICATION
T Ew S = S 7 =

(portions of table not shown remain unchanged)

SUBSTANTIATION:

This standard specifies requirements for materials, manufacture, physical characteristics, performance testing, and
markings for prefabricated, tileable shower receptors; and tileable and pre-tiled shower kits that are field installed,
which are not currently covered in the UPC.

60


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 059
UPC 2024 Section: 408.3.2

SUBMITTER: Jason M Shank
ASSE International

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

408.0 Showers.
408.3 Individual Shower and Tub-Shower Combination Control Valves. (remaining text unchanged)

408.3.2 Temperature Limiting. The maximum water temperature discharging from an individual showerhead shall
be limited to 120°F (49°C) by one of the following methods:

(1) A shower or tub/shower combination valve conforming to ASSE 1016/ASME A112.1016/CSA B125.16 where
either:

(a) The valve is field-adjusted to the required maximum temperature, or

(b) The handle position, stop, or temperature limiting control is set in accordance with the manufacturer's
instructions to the required maximum temperature.

(2) For gang showers supplied by a single water supply pipe, a mixing valve that conforms to ASSE 1069 that is
field-adjusted to the required maximum temperature.

U UCTV - U U U U

SUBSTANTIATION:
ASSE 1070, ASSE 1084 and ASSE 1062 are not designed for this application of individual showers.

61


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 060
UPC 2024 Section: 408.3.2

SUBMITTER: Bruce Fathers
Watts Water Technologies

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

408.0 Showers.

408.3 Individual Shower and Tub-Shower Combination Control Valves. Showers and tub-shower combinations
shall be provided with individual control valves of the pressure balance, thermostatic, or combination pressure
balance/thermostatic mixing valve type that provide scald and thermal shock protection for the rated flow rate of the
installed showerhead. These valves shall be installed at the point of use and comply with ASSE 1016/ASME
A112.1016/CSA B125.16 or ASME A112.18.1/CSA B125.1.
408.3.1 Gang Showers. Where gang showers are supplied with a single temperature-controlled water supply pipe,
it shall be controlled by a mixing valve that complies with ASSE 1069.
408.3.2 Temperature Limiting. The maximum water temperature discharging from an individual showerhead shall
be limited to 120°F (49°C) by one of the following methods:
(1) A shower or tub/shower combination valve conforming to ASSE 1016/ASME A112.1016/CSA B125.16 where
either:
(a) The valve is field-adjusted to the required maximum temperature, or
(b) The handle position, stop, or temperature limiting control is set in accordance with the manufacturer's
instructions to the required maximum temperature.
(2) For gang showers supplied by a single water supply pipe, a mixing valve that conforms to ASSE 1069 that is
field-adjusted to the required maximum temperature.
(3) A limiting device conforming to either ASSE 1070/ASME A112.1070/CSA B125.70 or CSA B125.3.
(4) A water heater conforming to ASSE 1084.
(5) A temperature actuated flow reduction device conforming to ASSE 1062.
(6)_Remote temperature monitoring, control and alert when lack line of sight. Temperature shall be permitted to be
monitored remotely via a sensor and App to alert if mixed water exceeds 120°F (49°C)_at the outlet. Temperature
can also be adjusted via remote means.

SUBSTANTIATION:

The addition of this language adds public safety. The provision provides visibility to shower temperatures in a
commercial facility mitigating scalding and Legionella risk, and allowing facility staff to respond quickly to over- and
under-temperature performance.

62


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 061
UPC 2024 Section: 408.3.3, Table 1701.1, Table 1701.2

SUBMITTER: Jason M Shank
ASSE International

RECOMMENDATION:
Add new text

408.0 Showers.
408.3 Individual Shower and Tub-Shower Combination Control Valves. (remaining text unchanged)

408.3.3 Individual Pressure Balancing In-Line Valves for Individual Fixture Fittings. \Where individual pressure
balancing_in-line valves for individual fixture fittings are installed, such valves shall comply with ASSE 1066. Such valves
shall be installed in an accessible location. The valves shall not be utilized alone as a substitute for the balanced
pressure, thermostatic or combination shower valves requirements.

TABLE 1701.1
REFERENCED STANDARDS

STANDARD STANDARD TITLE APPLICATION REFERENCED
NUMBER SECTION

ASSE 1066-1997 Ind?v?dual Pressure_ B_alancinq In-Line Valves for Valves 408.3.3
Individual Fixture Fittings -

Note: ASSE 1066 meets the requirements for a mandatory referenced standard in accordance with Section 3-
3.7.1 of IAPMO’s Regulations Governing Committee Projects.

(portions of table not shown remains unchanged)

TABLE 1701.2
STANDARDS, PUBLICATIONS, PRACTICES, AND GUIDES

DOCUMENT NUMBER DOCUMENT TITLE APPLICATION

ASSE-4066-1997 F".'d"""d“Fa. Pressure Balaneingin-bine-valves-for ndividual Valves

(portions of table not shown remains unchanged)

SUBSTANTIATION:

This standard applies to automatic pressure balancing in-line valves which are used to equalize incoming hot and
cold water line pressures for the purpose of minimizing mixed water temperature variations due to pressure
fluctuations when used in conjunction with a mixing valve or two handle valve set. They are not designed to limit the
maximum outlet temperature at the point-of-use. These devices are intended for use in individual plumbing fixtures
fittings such as shower heads, bath utility faucets, and sink and lavatory faucets.

63


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 062
UPC 2024 Section: 408.3.4

SUBMITTER: Jason M Shank
ASSE International

RECOMMENDATION:
Add new text

408.0 Showers.
408.3 Individual Shower and Tub-Shower Combination Control Valves. (remaining text unchanged)

408.3.4 Temperature-Actuated, Flow-Reduction Devices for Individual Fixture Fittings. Temperature-actuated,
flow-reduction devices, where installed for individual fixture fittings,_shall comply with ASSE 1062. A temperature-
actuated, flow-reduction device shall be an approved method for limiting the water temperature to not more than 120°F
(49°C) at the outlet of a faucet or fixture fitting. Such devices shall not be used alone as a substitute for the balanced-
pressure, thermostatic or combination shower valves requirements or as a substitute for bathtub or whirlpool tub water-
temperature-limiting_valves requirements.

Note: ASSE 1062 meets the requirements for a mandatory referenced standard in accordance with Section 3-
3.7.1 of IAPMO's Regulations Governing Committee Projects.

SUBSTANTIATION:

This standard applies to temperature actuated, flow reduction (TAFR) valves for individual supply fittings (herein
referred to as the “device”) that react to high temperature water. These valves are intended for use in-line with, or
integrated into, individual plumbing supply fittings such as shower heads, bath and utility faucets, and sink and
lavatory faucets. When intended for use by people with disabilities, TAFR valves covered by this standard shall also
comply with ICC Standard A117.1. The use of TAFR valves does not replace the requirements for valves compliant
to ASSE 1016 / ASME A112.1016 / CSA B125.16, ASSE 1069, or ASSE 1070 / ASME A112.1070 / CSA B125.70,
as outlined in the model codes.

64


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 063
UPC 2024 Section: 408.4

SUBMITTER: Kevin Ernst
0S&B

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

408.0 Showers.

408.4 Waste Outlet. Showers shall have a waste outlet and fixture tailpiece not less than 2 inches (50 mm) in diameter.
Fixture tailpieces shall be constructed from the materials specified in Section 701.2 for drainage piping. Strairers

(below shown for reference only)

404.0 Waste Fittings and Overflows.
404.1 Waste Fittings. Waste fittings shall comply with ASME A112.18.2/CSA B125.2, ASTM F409 or Table 701.2 for
aboveground drainage piping and fittings.

SUBSTANTIATION:

Current wording is design restrictive. The shower drain must comply to the requirements of ASME A112.18.2/CSA
B125.2 - 2020 as per Section 404.1. Within this standard there is a flow performance test in Sections 5.8.1 - 5.8.2.
As long as the shower drain is certified to the standard and meets the required flow rate, there isn't a need to be
prescriptive with the grate sizing.

65


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 064
UPC 2024 Section: 408.5

SUBMITTER: David Mann
CA State Pipe Trades Council

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

408.0 Showers.

408.5 Finished Curb or Threshold. Where a shower receptor has a finished dam, curb, or threshold, it shall be not less

than 1 inch (25.4 mm) lower than the sides and back of such receptor. In no case, shall a dam or threshold be less than

2 inches (51 mm) or exceeding 9 inches (229 mm) in depth where measured from the top of the dam or threshold to the

top of the drain. Each such receptor shall be provided with an integral nailing flange either integral or field installed in

accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions. te-belocated-where-thereceptormeets-the-vertical-surface
HR inter - The flange shall be watertight and extend vertically not less than 1

inch (25.4 mm) above the top of the sides of the receptor. The finished floor of the receptor shall slope uniformly from

the sides towards the drain not less than 1/8 inch per foot (10.4 mm/m), nor more than 1/2 inch per foot (41.6 mm/m).

Thresholds shall be of sufficient width to accommodate a minimum 22 inch (559 mm) door. Shower doors shall open so

as to maintain not less than a 22 inch (559 mm) unobstructed opening for egress. Where there is a shower without a

threshold, the floor space within the same room shall be considered a wet location and shall comply with the

requirements of the building, residential, and electrical codes.

Exceptions:

(1) Showers in accordance with Section 403.2.

(2) A cast-iron shower receptor flange shall be not less than 0.3 of an inch (7.62 mm) in height.

(3) For flanges not used as a means of securing, the sealing flange shall be not less than 0.3 of an inch (7.62 mm) in

height.

SUBSTANTIATION:

The shower receptor must be installed with the nailing flange at rough wall. If the flange were at the finished interior
the receptor would not be watertight. The 2021 UPC Section 408.1 requires manufactured shower receptors and
shower bases to comply with ASME A112.19.1/CSA B45.2, ASME A112.19.2/CSA B45.1, ASME
A112.19.3/CSAB45.4, CSA B45.12/IAPMO Z402, or CSA B45.5/IAPMO Z124. All these standards give three
options for the flanges:

(a) integral with the bathtub or shower base;

(b) added to an island tub or shower base in the factory; or

(c) field installed using a flange kit.

For this reason, Section 408.5 should be updated to allow for integral or field installed nailing flanges.

66


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 065
UPC 2024 Section: 408.6

SUBMITTER: Shane Peters
City of Santa Monica

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

408.0 Showers.

408.6 Shower Compartments. Shower compartments;regardiess-of-shape; shall have a mirimurm-finished interior efin
accordance with the following:

(1)_Not less than 1024 square inches (0.6606 mz);and—shau—alse—beueapab%ef—eﬂeempassmg

(2)_Be of sufficient dimension to accommodate a 30 inch (762 mm) circle.

The minimum required area and dimensions shall be measured at a height equal to the top of the threshold and a point
tangent to its centerline. The area and dimensions shall be maintained to a point of not less than 70 inches (1778 mm) above
the shower drain outlet with no protrusions other than the fixture valve or valves, showerheads, soap dishes, shelves, and
safety grab bars, or rails. Fold-down seats in accessible shower stalls shall be permitted to protrude into the 30 inch (762
mm) circle.

Exceptions:

(1) Showers that are designed to be in accordance with ICC A117.1.

(2) The minimum required area and dimension shall not apply for a shower receptor having overall dimensions of not less
than 30 inches (762 mm) in width and 60 inches (1524 mm) in length.

SUBSTANTIATION:

This change is intended to simplify the requirements for the area required for a shower compartment. Putting the
requirements into a list format is preferable to the language in a paragraph form and is easier to comprehend.
Additionally, an additional metric dimension is being added to simplify the dimension.

67


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 066
UPC 2024 Section: 408.7

SUBMITTER: Cathy Tran
MN DEPT OF LABOR & INDUSTRY

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

408.0 Showers.

408.7 Lining for Showers and Receptors. Shower receptors built on-site shall be watertight and shall be constructed
from approved-type dense, nonabsorbent, and noncorrosive materials. Each such receptor shall be adequately
reinforced, shall be provided with an approved flanged floor drain designed to make a watertight joint on the floor, and
shall have smooth, impervious, and durable surfaces. Unless the shower receptor is poured on the ground as part of a
slab, an approved shower liner shall be provided in accordance with the requirements of this section.

Shower receptors shall have the subfloor and rough side of walls to a height of not less than 3 inches (76 mm)
above the top of the finished dam or threshold shall be first lined with sheet plastic, lead, or copper, or shall be lined with
other durable and watertight materials. Showers that are provided with a built in place, permanent seat or seating area
that is located within the shower enclosure, shall be first lined with sheet plastic, lead, copper, or shall be lined with other
durable and watertight materials that extend not less than 3 inches (76 mm) above horizontal surfaces of the seat or the
seating area.

Lining materials shall be pitched 1/4 inch per foot (20.8 mm/m) to weep holes in the subdrain of a smooth and
solidly formed subbase. Such lining materials shall extend upward on the rough jambs of the shower opening to a point
not less than 3 inches (76 mm) above the horizontal surfaces of the seat or the seating area, the top of the finished dam
or threshold and shall extend outward over the top of the permanent seat, permanent seating area, or rough threshold
and be turned over and fastened on the outside face of both the permanent seat, permanent seating area, or rough
threshold and the jambs.

Nonmetallic shower subpans or linings shall be permitted to be built up on the job site of not less than three layers
of standard grade 15 pound (6.8 kg) asphalt impregnated roofing felt. The bottom layer shall be fitted to the formed
subbase and each succeeding layer thoroughly hot-mopped to that below. Corners shall be carefully fitted and shall be
made strong and watertight by folding or lapping, and each corner shall be reinforced with suitable webbing hot-mopped
in place.

Folds, laps, and reinforcing webbing shall extend not less than 4 inches (102 mm) in all directions from the corner,
and webbing shall be of approved type and mesh, producing a tensile strength of not less than 50 pounds per square

foot (Ib/ft2) (244 kg/mz) in either direction. Nonmetallic shower subpans or linings shall be permitted to consist of
multilayers of other approved equivalent materials suitably reinforced and carefully fitted in place on the job site as
elsewhere required in this section.

Linings shall be properly recessed and fastened to the approved backing so as not to occupy the space required
for the wall covering, and shall not be nailed or perforated at a point that is less than 1 inch (25.4 mm) above the
finished dam or threshold. An approved type subdrain shall be installed with a shower subpan or lining. Each such
subdrain shall be of the type that sets flush with the subbase and shall be equipped with a clamping ring or other device
to make a tight connection between the lining and the drain. The subdrain shall have weep holes into the waste line. The
weep holes located in the subdrain clamping ring shall be protected from clogging.

68


angela.cote
Rectangle


SUBSTANTIATION:

The proposed added language clarifies that an exception for onsite built shower receptors that are poured and built
directly on the ground, adequately reinforced, and watertight do not required shower liners as prescribed in the first
two sentences of the paragraph. The proposed change is consistent with the intent of the current language of this
section (408.7) but adds clarity to avoid continued confusion, for a more consistent code enforcement of this
provision. An acceptable shower receptor that qualifies is one that is poured-in-place receptor construction,
complete with integral threshold, sides and back directly supported by the underlying ground, and impervious
watertight receptor as prescribed. The existing language of this section requires sides and back of the receptor pour
must extend at least three inches above the finished threshold before wall covering.

69



Proposals

Item #: 067
UPC 2024 Section: 408.7.5

SUBMITTER: David Mann
CA State Pipe Trades Council

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

408.0 Showers.

408.7.5 Tests for Shower Receptors. Shower receptors shall be tested for watertightness by filling with water to
the levetoftherough-threshotd-a depth of not less than 2 inches (51 mm)_for not less than 15 minutes. Where no
threshold is present, a 2 inch (51 mm) barrier shall be temporarily constructed for testing. The test plug shall be so
placed that both upper and under sides of the subpan shall be subjected to the test at the point where it is clamped
to the drain.

SUBSTANTIATION:
The existing language does not have guidance for water depth or time requirement for testing the shower beds. The
proposed depths are standard in the industry and will assist the end user install a watertight shower receptor.

70


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 068
UPC 2024 Section: 408.9

SUBMITTER: Steven Hart
Public Health-Seattle & King County

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

408.9 Location of Valves and Heads. Control valves and showerheads shall be located on the a sidewall of the shower
compartments eretherwise and arranged so that the showerhead does not discharge directly at the entrance te into the
shower compartment se-that and the bather can adjust the valve(s) before stepping into the shower spray.

Exception: Shower valve(s) or shower head(s) can be placed in an alternate location when approved by the Authority
Having_Jurisdiction.

SUBSTANTIATION:

There may be occasions when the shower valve may need to be installed opposite of the shower door entrance
(rear wall) due to no access at side walls. There may be instances where the valves may need to be outside of the
shower compartment for safety reasons to prevent thermal shock rather than arranged at the rear wall of the shower
compartment. This is a concern for elderly, children, or persons with disabilities who would not expect thermal
shock.

71


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 069
UPC 2024 Section: 409.4

SUBMITTER: Bruce Fathers
Watts Water Technologies

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

409.0 Bathtubs and Whirlpool Bathtubs.

409.4 Limitation of Hot Water Temperature in Bathtubs and Whirlpool Bathtubs. The maximum hot water
temperature discharging from the bathtub and whirlpool bathtub filler shall be limited to 120°F (49°C). The maximum
temperature shall be regulated by one of the following means:

(1) A limiting device conforming to either ASSE 1070/ASME A112.1070/CSA B125.70 or CSA B125.3.

(2) A water heater conforming to ASSE 1084.

(3)_Remote temperature monitoring, control and alert when lack line of sight. Temperature shall be permitted to be
monitored remotely via a sensor and App to alert if mixed water exceeds 120°F (49°C)_at the outlet. Temperature can
also be adjusted via remote means.

SUBSTANTIATION:

The addition of this language adds public safety. The provision provides visibility to whirlpool temperatures in a
commercial/institutional facility mitigating scalding and Legionella risk and allowing facility staff to respond quickly to
over- and under-temperature performance via App alerts.

72


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 070
UPC 2024 Section: 409.6.1

SUBMITTER: Karan Kapila
Self

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

409.0 Bathtubs and Whirlpool Bathtubs.

409.6 Installation and Access. Bathtubs and whirlpool bathtubs shall be installed in accordance with the
manufacturer’s installation instructions. Access openings shall be of a size and opening to permit the removal and
replacement of the circulation pump.

Whirlpool pump access located in the crawl space shall be located not more than 20 feet (6096 mm) from an
access door, trap door, or crawl hole.

The circulation pump shall be located above the crown weir of the trap. The pump and the circulation piping
shall be self-draining to minimize water retention.
409.6.1 Suction Fittings. Suction fittings on whirlpool bathtubs shall comply with ASME A112.19.7/CSA B45.10.
(renumber remaining sections)

SUBSTANTIATION:
Whirlpool suction fitting are too important to be lost in a paragraph. This change relocates the suction fitting into it's
own section as it has nothing to do with access or installation.

73


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 071
UPC 2024 Section: 411.2

SUBMITTER: Karan Kapila
Self

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

411.0 Water Closets.

411.1 Application. Water closets shall comply with ASME A112.19.2/CSA B45.1, ASME A112.19.3/CSA B45.4, or
CSA B45.5/IAPMO Z124. Water closet bowls for public use shall be of the elongated type. In nurseries, schools,
and other similar places where plumbing fixtures are provided for the use of children less than 6 years of age, water
closets shall be of a size and height suitable for children’s use.

411.2 Hydraulic Performance. Water closet hydraulic performance shall be in accordance with ASME
A112.19.2/CSA B45.1.

(renumber remaining sections)

Note: ASME A112.19.2/CSA B45.1 meets the requirements for a mandatory reference standards in accordance
with Section 3-3.7.1 of IAPMO's Regulations Governing Committee Projects.

SUBSTANTIATION:
The maximum water closet flushing volume requirements and acceptable testing variations are specified in
ASME/ANSI A112.19.6 for hydraulic performance.

74


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 072

UPC 2024 Section: 411.2.1, 411.2.2. Table 1701.1, Table 1701.2

SUBMITTER: Bruce A Pfeiffer

Retired - City of Topeka

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

411.0 Water Closets.

411.2 Water Consumption. (remaining text unchanged)
411.2.1 Dual Flush Water Closets. Dual flush water closets shall comply with ASME A112.19.14 or IAPMO PS 50.
The effective flush volume for dual flush water closets shall be defined as the composite, average flush volume of

two reduced flushes and one full flush.
411.2.2 Dual Flush Valves. Dual flush water closet valves shall comply with IAPMO PS 50 or ASME A112.19.10.

(renumber remaining sections)

TABLE 1701.1

Closets or Water Closet Tanks with Integral Flush

Valves with a Dual Flush Device

REFERENCED STANDARDS
STANDARD STANDARD TITLE APPLICATION REFERENCED
NUMBER SECTION
ASME A112.19.10- Retrofit Dual Flush Devices for Water Closets Fixtures 411.2.2
2017
IAPMO PS 50-2019 Flush Valves with Dual Flush Device for Water Fixtures 411.2.1,411.2.2

(portions of table not shown remains unchanged)

Note: ASME A112.19.10 and IAPMO PS 50 meet the requirements for mandatory referenced standards in
accordance with Section 3-3.7.1 of IAPMO’s Regulations Governing Committee Projects.

TABLE 1701.2

STANDARDS, PUBLICATIONS, PRACTICES, AND GUIDES

Water-ClosetTank-with-an
| LE Ve . - Flush Devi

DOCUMENT NUMBER DOCUMENT TITLE APPLICATION

(portions of table not shown remains unchanged)

SUBSTANTIATION:

The current language is only covering water closets with integrated dual flush valves. However, there are dual flush
valves that are either separate flush valves or as part of a complete water closet assembly. The proposed change
will clarify the appropriate standard required for either.

75



angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 073
UPC 2024 Section: 411.3

SUBMITTER: Karan Kapila
Self

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

411.0 Water Closets.

411.3 Water Closet Seats. Water closet seats shall be properly sized for the water closet bowl type, and shall be of
smooth, non-absorbent material. Seats, for public_or employee use, shall be of the elongated type and either of the
open front type or have an automatic seat cover dispenser. Plastic seats shall comply with IAPMO Z124.5. Seats
that are integral to the water closet shall be of the same material as the fixture.

SUBSTANTIATION:

The proposed language will prevent different materials to be utilized as water closet seats. This will prevent
unsanitary conditions where bacteria can grow and collect in seams and glue if two or more materials are used.
Furthermore, the addition of employees clarifies the intent of place of work or public workspace as meeting the
same intent as the public.

76


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 074
UPC 2024 Section: 411.3

SUBMITTER: Bruce A Pfeiffer
Retired - City of Topeka

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

411.0 Water Closets.

411.3 Water Closet Seats. Water closet seats shall be properly sized for the water closet bowl type, and shall be of
smooth, non-absorbent material. Seats, for public use, shall be of the elongated type and either of the open front
type or have an automatic seat cover dispenser. Plastic seats with or without covers shall comply with IAPMO
Z124.5.

SUBSTANTIATION:
The proposed change is to concede with the reference standard as it addresses toilet seat covers as part of the
standard and therefore, it is needed for clarity.

77


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 075
UPC 2024 Section: 412.1

SUBMITTER: Karan Kapila
Self

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

412.0 Urinals.

412.1 Application. Urinals shall comply with ASME A112.19.2/CSA B45.1, ASME A112.19.19, or CSA
B45.5/IAPMO Z124. Urinals shall have an average water consumption not to exceed 1 gallon (3.8 Lpf) of water per
flush. The hydraulic performance for urinals using water for flushing_shall be in accordance with ASME
A112.19.2/CSA B45.1 or CSA B45.5/IAPMO Z124.

Note: ASME A112.19.2/CSA B45.1 and CSA B45.5/IAPMO Z124 meet the requirements for mandatory referenced
standards in accordance with Section 3-3.7.1 of IAPMO's Regulations Governing Committee Projects.

SUBSTANTIATION:
The maximum water volume supplied water-urinal should meet the requirements and acceptable testing variations
that are specified in ASME/ANSI A112.19.2/CSA B45.1 and CSA B45.5/IAPMO Z124 for hydraulic performance.

78


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 076
UPC 2024 Section: 412.1.1

SUBMITTER: Bruce A Pfeiffer
Retired - City of Topeka

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

412.0 Urinals.
412.1 Application. (remaining text unchanged)

412 1.1 Nonwater Urlnals Nonwater urinals shaII have a I|qU|d barrler sealant to ma|nta|n a trap seal. Nonwater

urlnals shaII be cleaned and malntalned in accordance with the manufacturer S mstructrons after |nstaIIat|on Where
nonwater urinals are installed, not less than one water supplied fixture rated at not less than 1 water supply fixture
unit (WSFU) shall be installed upstream on the same drain line to facilitate drain line flow and rinsing. Where
nonwater urinals are installed, they shall have a water distribution line rough-in to each individual urinal location to
allow for the installation of an approved backflow prevention device in the event of a retrofit.

SUBSTANTIATION:

Many of the new non-water type urinals include integral mechanical devices in their cartridges for the purpose of
odor control. The urinals and cartridges must be tested and must meet applicable standards, including tests for
adequate flow through the devices. They do not however meet the requirements of the Code because they may
cause a small reduction in flow. Removing this sentence would allow manufacturers the ability to explore the use of
designs that could possibly reduce or eliminate the odors associated with these products. These odor control
devices are not intended to take the place of the required liquid barrier seal and one is still required on all non-water
urinals as prescribed by Code.

79


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 077
UPC 2024 Section: 222.0, 412.1.1

SUBMITTER: Fredi Heimberg
STEADYFREDY LLC
Rep. URIMAT Schweiz AG

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

412.0 Urinals.

412.1.1 Nonwater Urinals. Nonwater urinals shall have a liquid barrier sealant or a membrane valve to maintain a trap
seal. Nonwater urinals shall permit the uninhibited flow of waste through the urinal to the sanitary drainage system.
Nonwater urinals shall be cleaned and maintained in accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions after installation.
Where nonwater urinals are installed, not less than one water supplied fixture rated at not less than 1 water supply
fixture unit (WSFU) shall be installed upstream on the same drain line to facilitate drain line flow and rinsing. Where
nonwater urinals are installed, they shall have a water distribution line rough-in to each individual urinal location to allow
for the installation of an approved backflow prevention device in the event of a retrofit.

2220 -T-
Trap. A fitting or device so designed and constructed as to provide, where properly vented, a liquid seal or a membrane
valve that will prevent the back passage of air without materially affecting the flow of sewage or wastewater through it.

SUBSTANTIATION:
Technical substantiation / reason statement for including membrane valves/traps for waterless urinals in the new
standard:

Membrane valves (traps) in waterless urinal applications were introduced more than 15 years ago and they have
proven their quality & effectiveness since then in worldwide applications. Traps operating according to the principle
described below are used by the majority of companies in the urinal market segment such as Geberit, Sloan/Falcon
Water Technologies, Franke, Keramag, Ideal Standard, Duravit, Kuhfuss, Sphinx, Culu, Whiffaway, URIMAT and
others. In Europa, Asia, South America and Australia they are widely used in waterless urinals. Today the majority
of the worldwide waterless urinal market operates on membrane-/trap- technology.

The membrane valves/traps are designed as one-way valves. The membrane traps can be made of waterproof
materials such as Rubber, Silicon or even plastic (LDPE) and these materials make the membrane trap hold the lips
close. When used, the valve opens in only one direction. It allows liquid (urine) to flow through and immediately
closes shut afterward. It prevents the stink by not letting the odor from the drainage pass back into the urinal. Just
like the liquid sealant, the membrane valve also needs to be replaced after a few thousand uses. Therefore, the
performance of such membrane valves is very good compared to the technology of a liquid barrier.

Another advantage of membrane valves in waterless urinals is the fact, that no barrier liquid is needed or has to be
renewed. Due to that chemicals which can cause health and safety issues can be completely avoided on these
products. In addition membranes are more reliable in terms of service and maintenance. They offer more security
when "flushing the urinal”, because there is no liquid barrier to break.

80


angela.cote
Rectangle


The similar rubber membrane technology is used for floor drains to prevent odor problems when water-siphons
become dry. These products are also well-established in the American market, for instance Green Drain.

The European guideline (https://eur-lex.europa.eu/legal-content/EN/TXT/HTML/?

uri=CELEX:32013D0641&from=DE) makes no difference for the trap technology, the trap as such (with liquid barrier
or with a membrane valve) has to fulfill the different test procedures.

81



Proposals

Item #: 083
UPC 2024 Section: 415.1, 415.2

SUBMITTER: Donald L. Strickland, FASPE, CPD, GPD
TK1SC

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

415.0 Drinking Fountains.

415.1 Application. Drinking fountains shall be self-closing and comply with ASME A112.19.1/CSA B45.2, ASME
A112.19.2/CSA B45.1, or ASME A112.19.3/CSA B45.4. Drinking fountains and bottle filling stations shall also
comply with NSF 61. Permanently installed electric water coolers and bottle filling stations shall also comply with UL
399.

415.2 Drinking Fountain Alternatives. Where food is consumed indoors, water stations shall be permitted to be
substituted for drlnklng fountalns Bottle f|II|ng statlons shall be permitted to be substituted for drinking fountains tip

. Drinking fountains shall not be required for an occupant

load of 30 or less.

SUBSTANTIATION:

The text is addressing a concern with health and safety. As written, the language is overly restrictive to allow only 50
percent of drinking fountains to be substituted with bottle filling stations. There are jurisdictions that find drinking
fountains unsanitary as many persons use it and there are no means of sanitizing drinking fountains. Additionally, if
bottle filling stations are accepted as an equal to drinking fountains, then bottle filling stations should comply to the
same requirements.

87


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 084
UPC 2024 Section: 416.3

SUBMITTER: Bruce Fathers
Watts Water Technologies

RECOMMENDATION:
Add new text

416.0 Emergency Eyewash and Shower Equipment.

416.2 Water Supply. Emergency eyewash and shower equipment shall not be limited in the water supply flow rates.
Where hot and cold water is supplied to an emergency shower or eyewash station, the temperature of the water supply
shall be controlled by a temperature actuated mixing valve complying with ASSE 1071. Where water is supplied directly
to an emergency shower or eyewash station from a water heater, the water heater shall comply with ASSE 1085. The
flow rate, discharge pattern, and temperature of flushing fluids shall be provided in accordance with ISEA Z358.1.
416.3 Remote Temperature Monitoring. Control and alert when lack line of sight. Temperature may be monitored
remotely via a sensor and App to alert if mixed water exceeds 85°F (29.4°C)_at the outlet. Temperature can also be
adjusted via remote means.

(renumber remaining sections)

SUBSTANTIATION:

The addition of this language adds Public Safety. The provision provides remote visibility to eye wash, face wash,
drench showers and combination unit outlet temperature mitigating scalding risk to eyes, face and body, and
allowing facility staff to respond quickly to over temperature conditions and bypass mode via App alerts.

88


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 085
UPC 2024 Section: 417.2 -417.4, 603.5

SUBMITTER: Bruce A Pfeiffer
Retired - City of Topeka

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

603.0 Cross-Connection Control.

603.5 Specific Requirements. Specific requirements for backflow prevention shall comply with Section 603.5.1
through Section-663-5:24 603.5.24.

447-2-603.5.19 Deck Mounted Bath/Shower Valves. Deck mounted bath/shower transfer valves with integral
backflow protection shall comply with ASME A112.18.1/CSA B125.1. This shall include handheld showers, and
other bathing appliances mounted on the deck of bathtubs or other bathing appliances that incorporate a hose or
pull out feature.

417-3-603.5.20 Handheld Showers. Handheld showers shall comply with ASME A112.18.1/CSA B125.1. Handheld
showers with integral backflow protection shall comply with ASME A112.18.1/CSA B125.1 or shall have a backflow
prevention device that complies with ASME A112.18.3 or ASSE 1014.

417-4-603.5.21 Faucets and Fixture Fittings with Hose Connected Outlets. Faucets and fixture fittings with pull
out spout shall comply with ASME A112.18.1/CSA B125.1. Faucets and fixture fittings with pull out spouts with
integral backflow protection shall comply with ASME A112.18.1/CSA B125.1 or shall have a backflow preventer
device that complies with ASME A112.18.3.

603-5-49-603.5.22 Plumbing Fixture Fittings. (remaining text unchanged)

603-5:20-603.5.23 Swimming Pools, Spas, and Hot Tubs. (remaining text unchanged)

603-5:24-603.5.24 Chemical Dispensers. (remaining text unchanged)

SUBSTANTIATION:

Section 417.2, Section 417.3 and Section 417.4 deal specifically with backflow protection for deck mounted
bath/shower valves, handheld showers and faucets, and fixture fittings with hose connected outlets. Requirements
for backflow protection of fixtures and appliances are found in Chapter 6 making it the logical chapter to relocate
these sections.

89


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 086
UPC 2024 Section: 417.5

SUBMITTER: Bruce A Pfeiffer
Retired - City of Topeka

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

417.0 Faucets and Fixture Fittings.

417.5 Separate Controls for Hot and Cold Water. Where two separate handles control the hot and cold water, the
handles shall be marked in such a manner to indicate to the user that the left-hand control of the faucet where
facing the fixture fitting outlet shall control the hot water. Faucets and diverters shall be connected to the water
distribution system so that hot water corresponds to the left side of the fixture fitting.

Single-handle mixing valves installed in showers and tub-shower combinations shall have the flow of hot

water corresponding to the markings on the fixture fitting.

SUBSTANTIATION:

While the Code states that the left-hand control of the faucet is to control the hot water supply, it does not require
markings on the faucet to indicate to the user which handle regulates the hot and cold water supply. This additional
language will require those markings.

90


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 087
UPC 2024 Section: 417.6

SUBMITTER: Jason M Shank
ASSE International

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

417.0 Faucets and Fixture Fittings.

417.6 Water Dispensers. All potable water dispensers directly connected to the plumbing system shall comply with
one of the following:

(1) Beverage faucets shall comply with ASME A112.18.1/CSA B125.1.

(2)_Dispensers that supply electrically heated or cooled water shall comply with ASSE 1023.

(3)_Electric devices that heat water shall comply with UL 499.

(4) Dispensers that include water treatment shall comply with ASSE 1023 and Section 611.0 based on the type of
water treatment technology.

(below shown for reference only)

611.0 Drinking Water Treatment Units.

Note: ASME A112.18.1/CSA B125.1, ASSE 1023, and UL 499 meet the requirements for mandatory
referenced standards in accordance with Section 3-3.7.1 of IAPMO’s Regulations Governing Committee
Projects.

SUBSTANTIATION:
ASSE 1023 has been updated with a change of the scope of the standard. This proposed change reflects these
changes. Other referenced standards with in this section have remained but listed in an easier to read order.

91



angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 088
UPC 2024 Section: 417.7

SUBMITTER: Jason M Shank
ASSE International

RECOMMENDATION:
Add new text

417.0 Faucets and Fixture Fittings.

417.7 Head Shampoo Sink Faucets. Head shampoo sink faucets shall be supplied with hot water that is limited to
not more than 120°F (49°C). Each faucet shall have integral check valves to prevent crossover flow between the hot
and cold water supply_connections. The means for regulating the maximum temperature shall be in accordance with
one of the following:

(1).A limiting device conforming to ASSE 1070/ASME A112.1070/CSA B125.70.

(2)_A water heater conforming to ASSE 1084.

(3)_A temperature-actuated, flow-reduction device conforming to ASSE 1062.

Note: ASSE 1070/ASME A112.1070/CSA B125.70, ASSE 1062, and ASSE 1084 meet the requirements for
mandatory referenced standards in accordance with Section 3-3.7.1 of IAPMO's Regulations Governing
Committee Projects.

SUBSTANTIATION:
Currently the UPC does not address these types of faucet usage. These provisions will address the proper
standards required for the health and safety of the public.

92



angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 089
UPC 2024 Section: 417.8

SUBMITTER: Jason M Shank
ASSE International

RECOMMENDATION:
Add new text

417.0 Faucets and Fixture Fittings.

having_an integral foot bathtub and footbaths, shall be limited to not more than 120°F (49°C) by a water-
temperature-limiting device that conforms to ASSE 1070/ASME A112.1070/CSA B125.70 or by a water heater
complying with ASSE 1084.

Note: ASSE 1070/ASME A112.1070/CSA B125.70 and ASSE 1084 meet the requirements for mandatory
referenced standards in accordance with Section 3-3.7.1 of IAPMO's Regulations Governing Committee
Projects.

SUBSTANTIATION:
Currently the UPC does not address these types of faucet usage. These provisions will address the proper
standards required for the health and safety of the public.

93


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 091
UPC 2024 Section: 420.3, Table 420.3

SUBMITTER: Robert Pickering
Eastern Research Group, Inc.
Rep. EPA WaterSense

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

420.0 Sinks.

420.3 Pre- Rmse Spray Valve. Commercial food service pre- rlnse spray valves shall have a maximum flow rate ef46
: &) in accordance with Table 420.3

and shall be eqmpped with an mtegral automatic shutoff.

TABLE 420.3
COMMERCIAL PRE-RINSE SPRAY VALVE MAXIMUM FLOW RATE
PRODUCT CLASS BY SPRAY FORCE MAXIMUM FLOW RATE, GPM
Product Class 1 (</= 5.0 ounces-force) 1.00
Product Class 2 (> 5.0 ounces-force and </= 8.0 1.20
ounces-force) I
Product Class 3 (> 8.0 ounces-force) 1.28

For Sl units: 1 gallon per minute = 3.785 L/min,_1 ounce-force = 0.0625 pound-force

SUBSTANTIATION:

Effective as of January 2019, the Department of Energy requires all pre-rinse spray valves to have a maximum flow
rate of 1.28 gallons per minute (or less, depending on the product’s spray force). See the energy conservation
standards specified in the Code of Federal Regulations at 10 CFR 431.266
(https://www.law.cornell.edu/cfr/text/10/431.266).

96



angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 092
UPC 2024 Section: Table 422.1

SUBMITTER: Arnie Rodio

Self
RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text
TABLE 422.1
MINIMUM PLUMBING FACILITIES'
owmueson | SONC
LAVATORIES SHOWERS EACILITIES 6.7
(FIXTURES PER PERSON)>: 6 (FIXTURES PER OTHER™"
PERSON) (FIXTURES PER
PERSON)

(portions of table not shown remain unchanged)

Notes:

1 The figures shown are based upon one fixture being the minimum required for the number of persons indicated or any
fraction thereof.

2 Arestaurant is defined as a business that sells food to be consumed on the premises.
a. The number of occupants for a drive-in restaurant shall be considered as equal to the number of parking stalls.
b. Hand-washing facilities shall be available in the kitchen for employees.

3 The total number of required water closets for females shall be not less than the total number of required water
closets and urinals for males.

4 For each urinal added in excess of the minimum required, one water closet shall be permitted to be deducted. The

number of water closets shall not be reduced to less than two-thirds of the minimum requirement.

Metering or self-closing faucets shall be installed on lavatories intended to serve the transient public.

Service sinks shall not be required for non-residential occupancies with an occupant load of 15 or less.

For business and mercantile occupancies, one common service sink shall be permitted when accessible to all

businesses and mercantile within 300 feet and within the same story.

~ | O

SUBSTANTIATION:

Note 6 is being added to remove the conflict with the building code and UPC regarding required service sinks. Note
7 is being added for flexibility as the language will allow businesses and mercantile occupancies to share a common
service sink within the same work/business area. Similarly, with common facilities from Section 422.4, the UPC
requires access to be within 300 feet on the same floor, it makes sense for the distance to be limited to the same.

97


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 093
UPC 2024 Section: 422.2

SUBMITTER: Julius Ballanco, P.E.
JB Engineering and Code Consulting, P.C.
Rep. Self

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

422.0 Minimum Number of Required Fixtures.

422.2 Separate Facilities. Separate toilet facilities shall be provided for each sex.

Exceptions:

(1) Residential installations.

(2) In occupancies with a total occupant load of 10 or less, including customers and employees, one toilet facility,
designed for use by no more than one person at a time, shall be permitted for use by both sexes.

(3) In business and mercantile occupancies with a total occupant load of 50 or less including customers and employees,
one toilet facility, designed for use by no more than one person at a time, shall be permitted for use by both sexes.
(4)_Separate facilities shall not be required where rooms have fixtures designed for use by both sexes and the water
closets are installed in privacy compartments. Urinals shall be located in an area that is visually separated from the
remainder of the room or each urinal shall be installed in a privacy compartment.

SUBSTANTIATION:

The Building Code added an allowance for all gender toilet rooms in the 2021 edition. This change provides a
correlation with the Building Code. All gender toilet rooms have become common place in other countries. The
water closets and urinals are located in privacy compartments while the lavatories are located in the open. There is
no issue with waiting time since everyone has access to all the fixtures. All gender toilet rooms also avoid any
discrimination regarding gender identity. This concept is gaining popularity in North America. Since the Building
Code allows such a design, the Uniform Plumbing Code should have a similar requirement. Otherwise, the code are
in conflict.

98


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 094
UPC 2024 Section: 422.2

SUBMITTER: Bruce A Pfeiffer
Retired - City of Topeka

RECOMMENDATION:
Add new text

422.0 Minimum Number of Required Fixtures.

422.2 Multiple Occupancy Buildings. Buildings having multiple types of occupancies, shall have separate toilet
facilities for each occupancy with the minimum number of fixtures prescribed in Table 422.1. A common set of
restrooms shall be permitted to be used to accommodate all of the building occupants when the following
requirements are met:

(1)_Restrooms shall be accessible to the occupants at all times.

(2)_ The maximum travel distance from the restrooms to any occupancy shall not exceed 300 feet (91 440 mm).
(3)_The total occupant load for the building_shall be determined by adding_the individual occupant loads

together. The minimum number of fixtures for the common restrooms shall be calculated at 50 percent female and
50 percent male based on the total occupant load and by using the occupancy requiring the greatest number of
fixtures per occupant load in accordance with Table 422.1.

(renumber remaining sections)

SUBSTANTIATION:

The renovation of older buildings to accommodate multiple types of occupancies has prompted design professionals
to request guidance on how to calculate the minimum fixtures required. This section will provide the guidelines for
those types of occupancies.

99



angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 095
UPC 2024 Section: 422.4.2

SUBMITTER: Andrew Klein
A S Klein Engineering, PLLC
Rep. Self Storage Association

RECOMMENDATION:
Add new text

422.0 Minimum Number of Required Fixtures.

422.4 Toilet Facilities Serving Employees and Customers. Each building or structure shall be provided with toilet
facilities for employees and customers. Requirements for customers and employees shall be permitted to be met
with a single set of restrooms accessible to both groups.

Required toilet facilities for employees and customers located in shopping malls or centers shall be permitted
to be met by providing a centrally located toilet facility accessible to several stores. The maximum travel distance
from entry to any store to the toilet facility shall not exceed 300 feet (91 440 mm).

Required toilet facilities for employees and customers in other than shopping malls or centers shall have a
maximum travel distance not to exceed 500 feet (152 m).

422.4.1 Access to Toilet Facilities. In multi-story buildings, accessibility to the required toilet facilities shall not
exceed one vertical story. Access to the required toilet facilities for customers shall not pass through areas
designated as for employee use only such as kitchens, food preparation areas, storage rooms, closets, or similar
spaces. Toilet facilities accessible only to private offices shall not be counted to determine compliance with this
section.

422.4.2 Factory, Industrial and Storage. The location and maximum distances of travel to required public and
employee facilities in factory, industrial and storage occupancies shall be permitted to exceed that required by
Section 422.4, provided that the location and maximum distance of travel are approved.

SUBSTANTIATION:

This proposal provides the AHJ the authority to increase the travel distance to restrooms from 500 ft and the
number of floors between restrooms from every other floor to something more appropriate in industrial and storage
buildings. Because these types of occupancies have extremely low occupancy rates, it is not a cost-effective use of
space or resources to require the same number of independent restrooms when they will rarely be utilized. The new
section recognizes that even though there may be members of the public present in some of these types of
occupancies, occupancy rates and dwell times are extremely low. This “exception allowance” is present in the I-
Codes.

100


angela.cote
Rectangle


Proposals

Item #: 130
UPC 2024 Section: 206.0, 603.5.17

SUBMITTER: Herb Hoeptner
Hoeptner Perfected Products

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

603.0 Cross Connection Control.

603.5.17 Potable Water Outlets and Valves. Potable water outlets, freeze-proof yard hydrants, combination stop-and-
waste valves, freeze resistant drinking_fountains or other fixtures that incorporate a stop and waste feature that drains
into the ground shall not be installed underground.

Exception: Drinking fountain freeze resistant sanitary shall be permitted to be installed underground.

206.0 -D-

and waste below the frost line to protect against freezing. The device is normally installed in a vertical position extending
from below the frost line to above grade.

Drinking Fountain Freeze Resistant Sanitary. An outdoor point of use valve used for potable water systems that
drains back into an internal reservoir below the frost line to protect against freezing The device is normally installed in a
vertical position extending_from below the frost line to above grade.

SUBSTANTIATION:

An outside frost free drinking fountain are most common at parks, sports complexes, hiking trails, bike trails, dog
parks and anywhere the public will need drinking water. The latest trend is to include bottle fillers and dog waterers.
To prevent them from freezing they incorporate a stop and waste vale to drain the system into the soil. Standard
yard hydrants(weep hole hydrants) that drain into the ground to prevent freezing, and all stop and waste valves are
prohibited from being buried underground. An outside frost free drinking fountain drains into the soil the same as a
weep hole hydrant or stop and waste and is currently not addressed as such in the UPC code. One can argue
whether or not someone can get cross contamination from a stop and waste claiming the use is for filling bucket, but
one cannot argue that the only purpose for a drinking fountain is to drink from it. Therefore it is imperative that we
guarantee the quality of the water coming from a drinking fountain.

Definitions: There is no current definition of Drinking Fountain Freeze Resistant or the subcategory, Drinking
Fountain Freeze Resistant Sanitary. These are generally accepted definitions.

Section 603.5.17 currently does not include outside frost free drinking fountains that use a stop and waste to protect
from freezing. To prevent this text from being misinterpreted to read that all frost free drinking fountains including
Sanitary frost free drinking fountains cannot be installed underground an exception needs to be added. Sanitary
drinking fountains have been specifically designed to be installed below the frost line and supply potable drinking
water.

Currently there are three manufacturers that manufacture a Sanitary Drinking Fountain that does not drain into the
soil to prevent freezing. For more information on Drinking fountains please see attached

Is your outside drinking fountain safe for drinking?
If you use or install outside drinking fountains or yard hydrants you might want to concern yourself with the

156


angela.cote
Rectangle


inevitable possibility that your potable water can become contaminated with harmful bacteria located in the soil.
Sure you hire the best contractors and you assume that you meet all the state and local requirements, but
sometimes that is not enough. Some code authorities adopt codes but don’t necessarily enforce them, leaving you
liable for any problems that develop. Some code authorities are slow to adopt the most current standards available,
thus newly adopt an old standard after you have completed your project again leaving you liable. In this litigious
society, sometimes you need to do more to ensure you do not become entangled in the litigation process.

How contaminated ground water can enter your potable water supply:

Typical outside drinking fountains and yard hydrants prevent freeze-ups by draining out of a “weep hole” deep in the
ground. They generally consist of a bubbler, or in the case of a yard hydrant, a head for attaching a hose, a riser
pipe, and a shutoff valve deep below the frost level. The term “weep hole” is derived from the fact that, when the
weep hole drinking fountain or yard hydrant is shut off, a hole in the side of the valve opens to drain all the water
from the riser into the soil below the frost line. These are sometimes referred to as Stop & Waste valves. A typical
problem for these “weep hole” devices is that, when the ground water level fluctuates, especially during the summer
months, or the device is used repeatedly so drain water does not have a chance to percolate into the ground, the
ground water level will rise above the weep hole filling the riser with soiled ground water that will be consumed by
the public. Each time the device is shut off (Fig. 1) and the weep hole opens, ground water will migrate into the
drinking fountain or yard hydrant. Each time the drinking fountain or hydrant is turned on (Fig. 2), that contaminated
migrated water enters the potable water supply system and exits the bubbler. That first drink of water can be nothing
but soiled, most likely contaminated water.

A secondary, and more serious, problem occurs when the rubber seal in the shutoff valve or air valve deteriorates
over time and begins to leak. When the valve on the kitchen sink leaks it is very noticeable as it will drip incessantly
forcing you to replace the rubber seal. Unfortunately when your drinking fountain or yard hydrant leaks, it usually
leaks out the weep hole deep in the ground undetected. From the surface no one is aware the device is leaking.
When a back siphonage condition occurs (Fig.3), that leak out will become a leak in, sucking contaminated muddy
water into the supply line. If the hydrant is located in a horse arena or cow barn, animal by-products will leach into
the potable water supply.

157



In the first scenario the end user can consume contaminated water. In the second scenario, it is far more serious
because the entire water supply can become contaminated which the public consumes. This means that possible
contamination from one drinking fountain or yard hydrant, in one area, could cross contaminate the public in other
areas or other commercial or private dwellings. Anyone connected to that water supply potentially can become
contaminated.

Lately, due to the deaths associated with e-coli outbreaks and other pathogens that have contaminated our water
supplies, there has been great concern regarding cross contamination between the soil, which carries animal by-
products, fertilizers and other waste, and the water supply.

The liability toward each state became such a concern that many states created their own drinking fountain and
yard hydrant requirements. Initially, states implemented requirements to isolate weep hole devices from the potable
water supply. These requirements included installing a testable RPP backflow preventer upstream of the hydrant
and then tagging the hydrant “danger unsafe water”. This solved two major concerns. First, it protected the potable
water supply from siphoning contaminated water into the public water system, and secondly, it attempted to notify
the public not to use the hydrant for any potable source. Naturally the obvious downside to this approach was that
drinking fountains and yard hydrants had to be used as a potable source. Drinking fountains are only used for
drinking, and yard hydrants are used for RV parks and campgrounds. A secondary down side is the cost associated
with the purchase and installation of a testable RPP backflow preventer, the difficulty in finding a location for the
backflow preventer to keep it from freezing and the added cost in annual inspection and testing of the backflow
preventer.

Innovative manufacturers soon developed a new breed of drinking fountains and yard hydrants to solve the
problems associated with the new requirements imposed on weep hole devices. These new devices are called
Sanitary Drinking Fountains (Fig. 4) and Sanitary Yard Hydrants.

These Sanitary devices work much the same way as a Weep Hole device in that when they are shut off the water in
the riser drains down and out a hole located below the frost line to prevent freezing. However, instead of draining
out a hole and into the soil, the Sanitary Hydrant, or Sanitary Drinking Fountain (Fig. 4), drains into a sealed tank.
When the hydrant is turned on again the water in the tank is expelled leaving the tank empty to repeat the cycle
when the device is again shut off. Because the Sanitary drinking fountain and yard hydrant drain into a tank there is
no cross contamination with the soil. Because the soil is not required for drainage the drinking fountain or yard
hydrant can be placed in any soil condition, even clay.

158



Fig .4

With the advent of the Sanitary Drinking Fountain and Sanitary Yard Hydrant, states were able to meet the needs
and safety requirements of the public. The problem for the state or local code officials was the cost, manpower and
liability in having to develop their own approval process and testing each manufacturer’s device for approval. In turn,
the varying requirements by each state made it difficult for manufacturers to make one product for all states.

ASSE (American Society of Sanitary Engineers) realized the need to develop a national standard to help states
avoid this liability and give manufacturers the ability to meet one set of requirements. After six years of debate and
research by code officials, manufacturers, engineers, consultants, and the public, ASSE Sanitary Yard Hydrant
Standard 1057 was completed. This standard requires that the hydrant not drain directly into the ground and it must
have a back flow preventer if a hose is capable of attachment. It stipulates required pressure and flow capabilities
and ensures proper freeze protection.

Its obvious that over the past few years the sanitary issue for drinking fountains and yard hydrants has become an
important issue for public safety, and although the 1057 Sanitary Yard Hydrant Standard has not yet specifically
addressed drinking fountains, it is important to realize ones potential risk of cross contamination and possible
liability when installing or specifying drinking fountains and yard hydrants. For yard hydrants, make sure they have
been tested by an approved test lab and listed by a third party certifier to the ASSE 1057 standard. For drinking
fountains make sure they are Sanitary drinking fountains where the freeze protection draining does not drain directly
into the ground.

159



Proposals

Item #: 131
UPC 2024 Section: 227.0, 603.5.17

SUBMITTER: Herb Hoeptner
Hoeptner Perfected Products

RECOMMENDATION:
Revise text

603.0 Cross Connection Control.

603.5.17 Potable Water Outlets and Valves. Potable water outlets, freeze-proof non-sanitary yard hydrants,
combination stop-and-waste valves, or other fixtures that incorporate a stop and waste feature that drains into the
ground shall not be installed underground.

installed underground.

227.0 -Y-

Yard Hydrant. A point-of-use valve used for nonpotable water systems that is protected against freezing by draining
residual water onto the soil (which can be a source of cross-contamination). The device is normally installed in a vertical
position extending from below the frost line to above grade.

Yard Hydrant, Sanitary. A point-of-use valve used for potable water systems that drains back into an internal reservoir
below the frost line to protect against freezing. The device incorporates a backflow prevention device with hose
connection outlet for potable water application. The device is normally installed in a vertical position extending from
below the frost line to above grade.

Note: ASSE 1057 meets the requirements for a mandatory referenced standard in accordance with Section 3-
3.7.1 of IAPMO's Regulations Governing Committee Projects.

SUBSTANTIATION:

Standard yard hydrants (weep hole hydrants) that drain into the ground to prevent freezing, are normally used for
irrigation but are typically attached to a potable water supply. It has been determined that weep hole yard hydrants
can cross contaminate to the potable water supply lines, contaminating homes and buildings upstream of the
hydrant. Those same hydrants are also being used for potable water supply for campsites, Recreational Vehicles
(RV) and trailer parks, creating more cross contamination problems for the end user's potable water. Please see
additional information

An ASSE 1057 Sanitary Yard Hydrant approved device protects the water supply from cross contamination with the
soil. These devices do not behave as a weep hole hydrant (such as a stop and waste device) as they do not have
an opening into the soil to drain the excess water from the device. Devices capture water in an internal reservoir
below the frost line to prevent cross contamination from the soil. They could be buried in a septic tank and still
deliver clean potable water as they are totally isolated from the surrounding soil conditions. This is why they have
been deemed Sanitary.

The purpose of this proposed change is to clarify the definition and installation of freeze resistant sanitary yard
hydrants which is currently not addressed in the UPC code

Definitions: There is no current definition of Yard Hydrant or the subcategory, Sanitary Yard Hydrant. These are
generally accepted definitions.

160


angela.cote
Rectangle


Section 603.5.17 can currently be misinterpreted to read that all yard hydrants including Sanitary yard hydrants
cannot be installed underground, when in fact the product is specifically designed to be installed below the frost line
and supply potable water. Currently there are three manufacturers that are listed to ASSE 1057 Sanitary Yard
Hydrant standard

In summary:

Most states have taken it upon themselves to require Sanitary Yard Hydrants to meet the ASSE 1057 Standard.
Any engineer who is familiar with ASSE 1057 will make it a requirement, even if the state does not, because they
are concerned for their own liability. The UPC code currently does not address Sanitary Yard Hydrants.

This verbiage, including the requirement to meet ASSE 1057, is currently used by most states. Any engineer who
specifies a yard hydrant will always specify a 1057 approved device for their own liability. This Sanitary Yard
Hydrant addition has been sorely neglected in the UPC codes.

Serious Cross Contamination In Yard Hydrants:

Due to the deaths associated with e-coli outbreaks and other pathogens that have contaminated our water supplies,
there has been great concern regarding cross contamination between the potable water supply and the soil, which
carries animal by-products, fertilizers and other hazardous materials.

Most of us are familiar with a standard “weep hole” Yard Hydrant as they have been around for years. Hundreds of
thousands of them are sold each year. They are used in campgrounds, RV parks, ranches, farms, gardens and
anywhere water is needed away from a building. However, most of us are unaware of the serious cross
contamination potential associated with the weep hole at the base of the hydrant. The common weep hole yard
hydrant consists of a head for attaching a hose, a riser pipe, and a shutoff valve deep below the frost level. The
term “weep hole” is derived from the fact that, when the weep hole hydrant is shut off, a hole in the side of the valve
opens up to drain all the water from the riser into the soil below the frost line, much like a Stop and Waste Valve.
Some are placed in a backfill of gravel to aid in draining

Most states agencies recognize the cross contamination potential anytime a hose is connected to a hydrant. Hoses
have the ability to be placed in high hazard environments, such as stock tanks, pesticide tanks or even lying on the
ground in mud puddles. Back Siphonage will cause these hazardous materials to be sucked back into the 